
 
 
Reference 
Number:  

FOI202526/078 

From: 
 

Private Individual 

Date: 
 

23 May 2025 

Subject: 
 

Clinical Systems contract details 

 
 
 Please provide information regarding the following system contracts:  

1. BI & Data Warehousing 
2. Cardiology 
3. Clinical Communication and Collaboration 
4. Diagnostic Reporting 
5. Digital Dictation 
6. Inpatient E-prescribing 
7. Integration Platform 
8. Oncology 
9. PACS 
10. Patient Administration System 
11. Patient Engagement Portal 
12. Radiology Information Systems 
13. Scheduling 
 
Please enter 'No System Installed' or ‘No Department’ under supplier name if your trust 
does not use the system or have the department: 
a) System type – 
b) Supplier name – 
c) System name – 
d) Date installed – 
e) Contract expiration – 
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No 
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No 
h) Procurement framework – 
i) Other systems it integrates with? – 
j) Total value of contract (£) – 
k) Notes (e.g. we are currently out to tender) – 

  
Q1 BI & Data Warehousing 
  
A1 a-c & g-j. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 
 
This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2024/25 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 052: 
https://www.lhch.nhs.uk/resources/disclosurelogs 
 
Enter the year into the Year field and reference number into the Search field then click 
Search. Select Download to open.  



 
 
e. 31/07/2025 
f. Yes 

  
Q2 Cardiology 
  
A2 Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.  
 
This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2022/23 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 067 
 
https://www.lhch.nhs.uk/resources/disclosurelogs 
Enter the year into the Year field and reference number into the Search field then click 
Search. Select Download to open. 

  
Q3 Clinical Communication and Collaboration 
  
A3 Information not held - no system in place 
  
Q4 Diagnostic Reporting 
  
A4 Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 
 
This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2024/25 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 217: 
https://www.lhch.nhs.uk/resources/disclosurelogs 
 
Enter the year into the Year field and reference number into the Search field then click 
Search. Select Download to open.  

  
Q5 Digital Dictation 
  
A5 Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 
 
This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2024/25 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 217: 
https://www.lhch.nhs.uk/resources/disclosurelogs 
 
Enter the year into the Year field and reference number into the Search field then click 
Search. Select Download to open.  

  
Q6 Inpatient E-prescribing 
  
A6 Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 
 
This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2024/25 Disclosure 



 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 052: 
https://www.lhch.nhs.uk/resources/disclosurelogs 
 
Enter the year into the Year field and reference number into the Search field then click 
Search. Select Download to open.  

  
Q7 Integration Platform 
  
A7 Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 
 
This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2024/25 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 052: 
https://www.lhch.nhs.uk/resources/disclosurelogs 
 
Enter the year into the Year field and reference number into the Search field then click 
Search. Select Download to open.  

  
Q8 Oncology 
  
A8 Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital (LHCH) is a specialist adult 

cardiothoracic centre. We do not offer any oncology treatment at LHCH. Patients 
requiring Oncology treatment are often referred to Clatterbridge Centre for Oncology.  
 
We advise directing oncology requests to them: 
https://www.clatterbridgecc.nhs.uk/about-centre/access-to-information/freedom-
information-foi  

  
Q9 PACS 
  
A9 Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 
This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2023/24 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 500: 
https://www.lhch.nhs.uk/resources/disclosurelogs 
 
Enter the year into the Year field and reference number into the Search field then click 
Search. Select Download to open.  

  
Q10 Patient Administration System 
  
A10 a-d & f-j. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 
This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2024/25 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 052: 
https://www.lhch.nhs.uk/resources/disclosurelogs 
 
Enter the year into the Year field and reference number into the Search field then click 
Search. Select Download to open.  
 



 
e. ICS - contract expires 31/03/2026 
    Emis - contract expires 20/12/2027 

  
Q11 Patient Engagement Portal 
  
A11 Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 
This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2024/25 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 188: 
https://www.lhch.nhs.uk/resources/disclosurelogs 
 
Enter the year into the Year field and reference number into the Search field then click 
Search. Select Download to open.  

  
Q12 Radiology Information Systems 
  
A12 a-d & f-k Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 
This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2023/24 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 563: 
https://www.lhch.nhs.uk/resources/disclosurelogs 
 
Enter the year into the Year field and reference number into the Search field then click 
Search. Select Download to open.  
 
e. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 
‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 
This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2023/24 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 500: 
https://www.lhch.nhs.uk/resources/disclosurelogs 
 
Enter the year into the Year field and reference number into the Search field then click 
Search. Select Download to open.  

  
Q13 Scheduling 
  
A13 Information not held - No specific system in place this part of our patient administration 

system ICS as per A10 
  

 


