Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital m

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOI1202526/024

Number:

From: Commercial

Date: 14 April 2025

Subject: Radiology IT Systems and Imaging Services

Q1 PACS Provider
a. Who is the developer of PACS software or service used within the trust?
b. Under which contract or tender is this PACS software or service supplied?
c. When does this contract for PACS software or service come up for renewal?

A1 a. Philips
b. NHS Supply Chain Direct Award
c. 2033

Q2 DICOM Routing
a. Who is the developer of DICOM routing software or service used within the trust?
b. Under which contract or tender is this DICOM routing software or service supplied?
c. When does this contract for DICOM routing software or service come up for renewal?

A2 a. Philips
b. NHS Supply Chain Direct Award
c. 2033

Q3 Vendor Neutral Archive (VNA)
a. Who is the developer of VNA software or service used within the trust?
b. Under which contract or tender is this VNA software or service supplied?
c. When does this contract for VNA software or service come up for renewal?

A3 Information not held - we do not have a vendor neutral archive system.

Q4 Teleradiology Services
a. Does your trust currently engage with any external teleradiology providers?
b. If yes, please name the providers involved, and provide any immediately available
statistics on the usage of these teleradiology services.
c. When do these contracts for teleradiology services come up for renewal?

A4 a. Yes
b. Medica
c. 31/01/2026

Q5 Medical Imaging Volumes
a. Please provide any immediately available statistics or raw data on medical imaging
volumes within the trust.

A5 Information not held - We don't have data on archive storage as this is managed by
Philips
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