Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital m

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOI1202526/013

Number:

From: Private Individual

Date: 09 April 2025

Subject: Usage of Insourcing for 01/01/2025-31/03/2025 by speciality
Please can | request the below information on the utilisation of Insourcing for the
following period 01/01/2025-31/03/2025

Q1 Total spend during the period for Insourcing for the below specialties:
a. Neurology
b. Neurophysiology
c. Dermatology
d. Gastroenterology
e. Endoscopy
f. Cardiology
g. Respiratory
h. Orthodontics / Dental
i. Oral and maxillofacial surgery (OMFS)
j- ENT
k. Rheumatology
I. Gynaecology

A1 a. Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult
cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Neurology services.
b. Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult
cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Neurophysiology services.
c. Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult
cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Dermatology services.
d. Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult
cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Gastroenterology services.
e. Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult
cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Endoscopy services.
f. Information not held — no insourcing used for this period
g. Information not held — no insourcing used for this period
h. Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult
cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Orthodontics / Dental services.
i. Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult
cardiothoracic centre and does not perform Oral and maxillofacial surgery.
j- Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult
cardiothoracic centre and does not provide ENT services.
k. Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult
cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Rheumatology services.
I. Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult
cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Gynaecology services.

Q2 Please break the spend down by insourcing company
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Information not held — no insourcing used for this period

Please confirm if there was a budget for insourcing for the specialties outlined during the
same period

Information not held — as per A1

What was the service type relating to the specialties outlined, for example, outpatient,
diagnostic or theatres.

Information not held — as per A1

Was it a fully managed service or Team provision

Information not held — as per A1

Please can you confirm the Frameworks utilised for each specialty
Information not held — as per A1

Please confirm any direct awards or mini competitions which are being utilised for each
specialty

Information not held — as per A1

Total procedures completed by insourcing companies for the specialties outlined during
the same period

Information not held — as per A1



