
 
 
Reference 
Number:  

FOI202425/350 

From: 
 

Commercial 

Date: 
 

08 November 2024 

Subject: 
 

Inventory management / point of care solutions 

 
Q1 Does the Trust / Health Board use a third-party inventory management / point of care 

solution?  
 
If yes – please confirm:  
a. Which inventory management / point of care solution you use.  
b. Contract value (p.a.)  
c. Contract renewal date  
d. When did the Trust / Health Board first start using this solution? 

  
A1 a. Omnicell - third party IMS but managed internally. 

b. £139,088.59 (Total EX VAT) 
c. 29/09/2026 
d. Information not held - this precedes our current procurement service, HPL. 

  
Q2 If no – does the Trust / Health Board use any internally-built IT inventory management / 

point of care solutions? 
  
A2 Not applicable, as per A1 above 
  
Q3 Please could you indicate which department(s) in the Trust / Health Board use inventory 

management / point of care solutions, whether third-party or internal? 
  
A3 Department Use third-party 

inventory management 
/ point of care solution  

Use in-house 
inventory 
management / point of 
care solution 

Accident and emergency 
(A&E)  

Information not held – we do not have an 
A&E department 

Diagnostic imaging / 
radiology  

No No 

Endoscopy  No No  

Mental Health  Information not held – we do not treat patients 
for mental health conditions. 

Obstetrics  Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest 
Hospital is a specialist adult cardiothoracic centre 
and does not have Obstetric, Maternity or Labour 
and Delivery services 

Oncology  Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest 
Hospital (LHCH) is a specialist adult cardiothoracic 
centre. We do not offer any oncology treatment at 
LHCH.   



 
Paediatrics  Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest 

Hospital (LHCH) is a specialist adult cardiothoracic 
centre. We do not offer any paediatric services at 
LHCH. 

Surgical procedures 
(day-patient / in-patient)  

 No Omnicell 

Surgical procedures (out-
patient)  

 No Omnicell 

 

 


