Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital m

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOI1202425/393

Number:

From: Private Individual

Date: 28 November 2024

Subject: Radiology Reporting Services

Q1 The names of your outsourced teleradiology providers for:
a. Out of hours, emergency reporting (overnight reporting).
b. Routine Elective Reporting.

Al a. Information not held - we do not outsource teleradiology for this.
b. Name of Teleradiology: MEDICA. Only routine elective CT and MRI are outsourced.

Q2 Please provide the annual volumes for both 2023 and for 2024 sent to each provider,
broken into the following:
a. Overnight Emergency
b. Routine Elective Reporting (MRI, CT)
c. Plain Film Reporting
d. Day time emergency reporting (1hr for example).
e. Splitinto each hospital within the Trust

A2 a. Overnight Emergency - Information not held - we do not outsource teleradiology for
this.

b. Routine Elective Reporting (MRI, CT) —
e 2023:3,714
e 2024: 3,980

c. Plain Film Reporting - Information not held - we do not outsource teleradiology for
this.

d. Day time emergency reporting (1hr for example) - Information not held - we do not
outsource teleradiology for this.

e. Splitinto each hospital within the Trust - we only have one hospital in the Trust which
is the Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital

Q3 Start date, duration and end date of any contracts with tele-radiology providers?

A3 Contract Start Date: Aug 2016
Current contract is on a yearly review

Q4 Was the contract procured via a framework (direct award), mini-tender, or ITT
procurement process?

A4 Via a framework
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NHS Foundation Trust

Q5 Who is the senior officer (outside of procurement) responsible for this contract?

A5 Kiran Chokkar, Divisional Director of Ops



