Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital m

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOI202425/312
Number:
From: Private Individual
Date: 18 October 2024
Subject: The recruitment of agency staff within Facilities, Estates, Administrative /
Clerical and Ambulance / Patient Transport
Q1 In the period 1st October 2023 to 30th September 2024, please confirm which
framework was used for the recruitment of agency staff within the following categories:
a. Facilities
b. Estates
c. Administrative / Clerical
d. Ambulance / Patient Transport
Al a. Information not held — We do not use agency staff within Facilities.
b. Information not held - no agency recruitment for this period.
c. HTE Framework
d. Information not held — we do not operate Ambulance/Patient Transport
Q2 In the period 1st October 2023 to 30th September 2024, please provide a breakdown
month by month of total trust spend for framework agency staff within the following
categories:
a. Facilities
b. Estates
c. Administrative / Clerical
d. Ambulance / Patient Transport
A2 a. Information not held — We do not use agency staff within Facilities.

b. Information not held - no agency recruitment for this period.

C.
Month Cost
Oct-23 £0.00
Nov-23 £0.00
Dec-23 £0.00
Jan-24 £3,597.00
Feb-24 £3,970.00
Mar-24 £1,281.00
Apr-24 £0.00
May-24 £1,559.00
Jun-24 £7.00
Jul-24 £244.00
Aug-24 £0.00
Sep-24 £0.00
Total £10,658.00

d. Information not held — we do not operate Ambulance/Patient Transport



Q3

A3

Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital m

NHS Foundation Trust

In the period 1st October 2023 to 30th September 2024, please provide a breakdown
month by month of total trust spend for off-framework agency staff within the following
categories:

a. Facilities

b. Estates

c. Administrative / Clerical

d. Ambulance / Patient Transport

a-d. Information not held — We do not use off-framework agencies



