

Reference FOI202425/309

Number:

From: Private Individual

Date: 18 October 2024

Subject: Outsourced services

- Q1 Do you outsource any of the following services (please clarify whether static or mobile)?
 - a. MRI
 - b. CT
 - c. Cardiac catheterisation lab
- A1 a. No
 - b. No
 - c. Information not held no outsourcing used in the Cardiac catheterisation lab, pacing or EP procedures.
- Q2 If so, who is the provider of the respective service?
- A2 Information not held as per A1
- Q3 Have the Trust entered into any arrangements with private sector providers to deliver any elements of their Community Diagnostic Centre?
- A3 Information not held we do not have a Community Diagnostic Centre
- Q4 If so, which elements, how long is the contract and what is the total contract value?
- A4 Information not held as per A3