Reference FOI202425/287

Number:

From: Private Individual

Date: 08 October 2024

Subject: Prevent Referrals (2019-2024)

For each financial year (April 2019-March 2020, April 2020-March 2021, April 2021-March 2022, April 2022-March 2023 and April 2023-March 2024 - or as close to these time frames as possible), please provide:

Q1 a. The number of Prevent referrals made by your Trust?

- b. The number of your Trust's Prevent referrals that have been discussed at the Channel Panel?
- c. The number of people that your Trust referred under Prevent who received Channel support?

A1		2019-2020	2020-2021	2021-2022	2022-2023	2023-2024
	a	2	1	0	1	0
	b	Information not held – Channel panel is an external panel that is run by				
	С	Liverpool City council and Merseyside Police. As such, the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data.				

- Q2 a. Whether the referral was made by a mental health service/department, or a nonmental health service/department?
 - b. The ethnic groups of the referred people?
 - c. The religious/faith groups of the referred people?
 - d. The type of concern?
- A2 a. All referrals made by non-mental health service/department.
 b & c. Information not held the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data.
 d. All referrals made for general concern for potential for radicalisation.
- All recorded information in the form of (i)Correspondence including emails & letters, (ii)Documents, (iii)Meeting Minutes held by or on behalf of the Trust since October 1st 2023, referencing the terms ['Prevent' or 'Prevent Duty' or 'Prevent Referral'] collocated with the terms ['Palestine' or 'Palestinian' or 'Gaza' or 'Israel' or 'Israeli' or 'Middle East'].
- A3 Information not held the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data.