Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital MIB

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOI1202425/217

Number:

From: Private Individual

Date: 21 August 2024

Subject: Clinical systems information

Please proved information regarding the following systems:

Please enter 'No System Installed' or ‘No Department’ under supplier name if your trust does not
use the system or have the department:
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System type —

Supplier name —

System name —

Date installed —

Contract expiration —

Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No
Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No
Procurement framework —

Other systems it integrates with? —

Total value of contract (£) —

Notes (e.g. we are currently out to tender) —

Accident & Emergency

Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult
cardiothoracic centre and does not have an Accident & Emergency department.

Diagnostic Reporting

Radiology Information System
Magentus

CRIS

2008

2027

No

No

Procured via tender process.
PAS, PACS, Veye

£73,100

None
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Digital Dictation

Dictation Software
Bluewire Technologies Ltd
Epro

01/04/2022

31/03/2027
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NHS Shared Business Services
PAS system
£444 000.00

. None

Discharge Letters
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Patient Administration System
Alcidion

ICS

01/10/2015

31/03/2025

No

No

Procured via tender process.
EPR

£2,252,741.00

None

Document Management
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Electronic Document Management system
Hyland

On Base

2012

2025

No

No

Trust own Tender

EPR

£70,000 annual support
None

Maternity

Information is not held in relation to any of the above questions. Liverpool Heart and
Chest Hospital NHS Foundation Trust is a specialist cardiothoracic centre and therefore

NHS Foundation Trust

does not have a maternity ward or any maternity related services.

Order Communications
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Electronic Patient Record
Altera Healthcare

Sunrise Clinical Manager
13/06/2013

31/05/2025

No

No

NHS Shared Business Services

Trusts PAS, Radiology, Lab, Observation devices

£1,917, 665. 00
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NHS Foundation Trust

k. None
Outcomes/performance benchmarking

Performance Benchmarking

Dr Foster

Telestra Health

Information not held - Initial installation date is not centrally stored however the
current contract started 01/06/2022.

31/05/2025

Yes

No

None

None. It doesn't integrate with any of our systems, it's a standalone product that gets
data from HES (Hospital Episode Statistics), which is derived from the
commissioning data that we submit routinely.

j- £46,210

k. None
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Trust Integration Engine (TIE)

a) Integration Engine

b) Rhapsody

c) Rhapsody

d) August 2017

e) September 2026

f) No

g) No

h) Crown Commercial Service (CSS) Framework

i) Care cube, Mirth, Tquest, EMIS, Blue Cherry, MESH. MS Exchange, Forcare, Cipha
Jocap ICS ISCV Ascribe Draeger Mindray OnBase GemWeb Plus Ward Watcher
ISLA Aqure InTouch With Health Medicus EPRO Cobalt Dose Monitor CIMAR
Veye CRIS Vue SCM Telepath ICNet Pharm Outcomes Gov UK Notify Sample360
j) £60,715

k) None

Voice recognition

As per A3



