
 
 
Reference 
Number:  

FOI202425/224 

From: 
 

Commercial 

Date: 
 

23 August 2024 

Subject: 
 

Agency Spend, Agency Locums, Department Contacts 

 
Q1 Total Spend on Temporary Locums (Agency - Doctors Only NOT BANK LOCUMS) 

broken down into the following specialties and sites of each Trust belonging to NHS 
England – From January 2024 – August 2024 
 
a. Anaesthetics 
b. ICU 

  
A1 a. Zero 

b. Zero 
  
Q2 Locum Agency providers – Please can you advise which locum agencies you use to fill 

the following areas. 
 
a. Anaesthetics 
b. ICU 

  
A2 Information not held – we do not use Locum Agency providers 
  
Q3 Department contact’s – Please can you provide name or email address of the following 

departments, 
 
a. Anaesthetics  
Rota Coordinator 
Service Manager 
Clinical Lead 
 
b. ICU  
Rota Coordinator 
Service Manager 
Clinical Lead  

  
A3 a. Information not held – no such roles as rota coordinator or service manager for 

Anaesthetics. 
Clinical Lead - Omar AlRawi, Omar.AlRawi@lhch.nhs.uk 
 

b. Information not held – no such roles as rota coordinator or service manager for 
Critical Care Unit. 
Clinical Lead for Critical Care Unit - Neil Coulson, Neil.Coulson@lhch.nhs.uk  
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