Reference FOI202425/131

Number:

From: Private Individual

Date: 24 June 2024

Subject: Weight Management Clinics and Treatment Pathways

- Q1 Does the trust have a specialist obesity or weight management Clinic for
 - a) Children between ages 4-18
 - b) Adults
- A1 a) Information not held Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult cardiothoracic centre.
 - b) Information not held- there are no specialist obesity or weight management clinics at Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital.
- Q2 Number of patients treated in the last financial year
 - a) Children between ages 4-18
 - b) Adults
- A2 a) Information not held Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult cardiothoracic centre.
 - b) 13,921
- Q3 What treatment pathways for obesity or weight management do the Trust provide?
- A3 Information not held- as per A1b
- Q4 The average number of visits per year to the obesity or weight management clinic.
- A4 Information not held- as per A1b
- Q5 Please provide the following information for the Lead Clinician for Obesity services
 - a) Name
 - b) Job Title
 - c) Email
- A5 Information not held- as per A1b
- Q6 Does the Trust use a specialist software platform for obesity or weight management clinics?
- A6 No
- Q7 If yes to Q6, please provide:
 - a) The name of the supplier
 - b) The length of the contract
 - c) Total contract value



- A7 Information not held, as per A6
- Q8 Please provide Total financial costs to the trust for obesity and weight management services provided for the last financial year?
- A8 £0
- Q9 If the Trust does not have an obesity or specialist weight management clinic, is there a plan to develop one in the next 3 years? This would include the acquisition of a specialist software platform to help management of patient.
- A9 No