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Q1 How much money the trust made from car parking charges in 2022/23 (i.e., the year 

ending March 2023) and in 2023/24 (i.e., the year ending March 2024). 
For both years, could you please give: 
a) the overall total 
b) if possible, separate figures for staff and visitor/patient parking 

  
A1 Information not held- on site car parking is managed by the Liverpool University  

Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust. 
  
You may want to consider re-submitting your request to them on the following address: 
FOIRequests@liverpoolft.nhs.uk. 
 
Some information regarding the Trust’s car parking facilities can be found on our 
website at: http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/our-patients/parking/  

  
Q2 How much money was made from car parking fines in 2022/23 and 2023/24.  

For both years, could you please give: 
a) the overall total 
b) if possible, separate figures for staff and visitor/patient parking 

  
A2 Information not held, as per A1. 
  
Q3 a) Did you increase the cost of parking in your car parks from 2022/23 to 2023/24? 

b) If yes, please provide a breakdown of the increase(s)  
  
A3 Information not held, as per A1. 
  
Q4 Did you charge for disabled parking in 2023/24?  
  
A4 No 
  
Q5 a) Were any of your car parks managed by a private firm in 2023/24?  

b) If yes, what proportion of revenue from parking income did the firm take? 
c) What proportion of revenue from parking fines did the firm take? 

  
A5 Information not held, as per A1. 
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