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Q1 Within the Liverpool Heart & Chest NHS Foundation Trust could you please advise who 

is the most senior person responsible within their job roles for:- 
 
a) Commissioning 
 
b) Performance, Improvement and Planning 
 
c) Urgent and Emergency Care 
 
d) Innovation 
 
e) Community Services 
 
f) Community Transformation 
 
g) Elective Recovery 
 
h) Integrated Care 
 
i) Virtual Wards IT System 
 
j) Integrated Discharge 
 
k) Strategic Programme Delivery 

  
A1 a) Information not held- we are a provider organisation so do not have a commissioning 

lead. 
b) Jonathan Matthews- Chief Operating Officer 
c) Information not held- Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital does not have an A+E 
department. 
d) Shirley Pringle- Director of Research & Innovation 
e-f) Elaine Gossage- Clinical Business Manager 
g) Lucy Currie - Divisional Director of Operations, Surgery 
h) Joan Matthews- Director of Nursing 
i) Information not held- Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital do not hold the contract for 
Virtual Wards. Virtual Ward system was procured by Mersey care. Please re-direct your 
request to: FOI@merseycare.nhs.uk 
j) Joan Matthews- Director of Nursing 
k) Thomas Pharoah- Director of Strategy & Partnerships 

  
Q2 In addition, could you please advise the name of the: 

a) Chief Nurse 

mailto:FOI@merseycare.nhs.uk


 
b) Chief Nursing Information Officer 
c) Director of Operations. 

  
A2 a-b) Director of Nursing- Joan Matthews 

c) Chief Operating Officer- Jonathan Matthews 
  

 


