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Reference FOI1202425/048

Number:

From: Private Individual

Date: 24 April 2024

Subject: Information Regarding Outsourced Teleradiology Reporting Contracts
Q1 Please confirm the below information for each contract you hold with a teleradiology

reporting provider:

a) Name

b) Contract start date

c) Contract end date

d) Option for extension/roll-over period

e) Procurement route/framework used

f) Exclusivity or volume commitment within contract

g) When did you last benchmark the contract against other options available?

h) h) Do you expect to replace or renew the contract in 20247

A1 a) MEDICA

b) August 2016

c) 01/04/2024

d) 12 months

e) Trust Tender

f) Information not held - this is not applicable to this contract.

g) At last contract renewal

h) No

Q2 Please provide the below information for each teleradiology provider above:

a) Number of CT/MRI examinations reported between 1st September 2023 and 31st
December 2023 inclusive that require a 1-hour turnaround time or quicker
(Emergency reporting)

b) Please confirm the daily start and end time of your external Emergency reporting
provision?

c) Number of CT/MRI examinations reported between 1st September 2023 and 31st
December 2023 inclusive that require a turnaround time of between 1 and 12 hours
(Urgent reporting)

d) Number of CT/MRI examinations reported between 1st September 2023 and 31st
December 2023 inclusive that require a turnaround time of 24 hours (Urgent
reporting)

e) Number of CT and MRI examinations reported between 1st September 2023 and
31st December 2023 that require reporting in over 24 hours turnaround time
(General reporting)

f) Number of X-Ray examinations reported between 1st September 2023 and 31st

A2 a)

December 2023 that require reporting in over 24 hours turnaround time (General
reporting)

Zero



Q3

A3

Q4

A4
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) 8am to 8pm.

c) CT- Zero, MRI- Zero
d) CT- Zero MRI- Zero
e) CT-722 MRI- 162

f) Zero

Please provide the below information for each teleradiology provider above:

a) Total financial expenditure for CT/MRI examinations reported between 1st
September 2023 and 31st December 2023 inclusive that require a 1-hour turnaround
time or quicker (Emergency reporting)

b) Total financial expenditure for CT/MRI examinations reported between 1st
September 2023 and 31st December 2023 inclusive that require a turnaround time of
between 1 and 12 hours (Urgent reporting)

c) Total financial expenditure for CT/MRI examinations reported between 1st
September 2023 and 31st December 2023 inclusive that require a turnaround time of
24 hours (Urgent reporting)

d) Total financial expenditure for CT and MRI examinations reported between 1st
September 2023 and 31st December 2023 inclusive that require a 48 hour
turnaround time or longer (General reporting)

e) Total financial expenditure for Xray examinations reported between 1st September
2023 and 31st December 2023 inclusive that require a 48-hour turnaround time or
longer (General reporting)

a-e: Information not held — we do not hold this information in the requested format, i.e.
by different turnaround times.

If you do not use a teleradiology provider for your emergency reporting:

If Emergency reporting (up to 1-hour) is not outsourced, then please confirm the number
of examinations reported locally between 1st September 2023 and 31st December 2023
inclusive that require a 1-hour turnaround time or quicker (Emergency reporting)
between the hours of 5pm and 9am

Not applicable, as A2 above.



