
 
 

Reference 
Number:  

FOI202425/052 

From: 
 

Private Individual 

Date: 

 

25 April 2024 

Subject: 

 

Clinical Systems Information 

 

Please provide information regarding the following systems: 
  

Q1 Analytics (PLICS) 

 
a) System type- 

b) Supplier name- 
c) System name- 

d) Date installed- 
e) Contract expiration- 

f) Is this contract annually renewed- 

g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? 
h) Procurement framework 

i) Other systems it integrates with?- 
j) Total value of contract- 

k) Note- e.g. we are currently out to tender- 
  

A1 a) Cloud based costing software 
b) Logex 

c) Logex Costing 

d) January 2020 
e) December 2024 

f) Yes 
g) No 

h) No Framework - direct agreement with supplier 
i) None 

j) £129,354 

k) Not applicable 
  

Q2 BI & Data Warehousing 
 

a) System type- 
b) Supplier name- 

c) System name- 
d) Date installed- 

e) Contract expiration- 

f) Is this contract annually renewed- 
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? 

h) Procurement framework 
i) Other systems it integrates with?- 

j) Total value of contract- 
k) Note- e.g. we are currently out to tender- 

  

A2 a) BI Tool 



 
b) Microsoft 

c) Power BI 
d) Autumn 2021 

e) March 2024 
f) In process of being renewed 

g) No 

h) NHS SBS 
i) SQL Server 

j) £380,513.09 
k) Not applicable 

  
Q3 Cardiology 

 

a) System type- 
b) Supplier name- 

c) System name- 
d) Date installed- 

e) Contract expiration- 
f) Is this contract annually renewed- 

g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? 

h) Procurement framework 
i) Other systems it integrates with?- 

j) Total value of contract- 
k) Note- e.g. we are currently out to tender- 

  
A3 Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 

This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2022/23 Disclosure 

Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 067 
https://www.lhch.nhs.uk/resources/disclosurelogs 

 
Enter the year into the Year field and reference number into the Search field then click Search. 

Select Download to open. 
  

Q4 E-Rostering (staffing) 
 

a) System type- 
b) Supplier name- 

c) System name- 

d) Date installed- 
e) Contract expiration- 

f) Is this contract annually renewed- 
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? 

h) Procurement framework 
i) Other systems it integrates with?- 

j) Total value of contract- 
k) Note- e.g. we are currently out to tender- 

  

A4 a) Allocate  
b) Allocate Software Limited 

c) Allocate 
d) 2016 

https://www.lhch.nhs.uk/resources/disclosurelogs


 
e) 30/09/2024 

f) Yes 
g) No 

h) HSSF Framework 
i) Electronic Staff Record (ESR) 

j) £472,940.40 

k) Not applicable 
  

Q5 Integration Platform 
  

a) System type-  
b) Supplier name-  

c) System name-  

d) Date installed-  
e) Contract expiration-  

f) Is this contract annually renewed- 
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? 

h) Procurement framework 
i) Other systems it integrates with?- 

j) Total value of contract- 

k) Note- e.g. we are currently out to tender- 
  

A5 a) Integration Engine 
b) b Rhapsody 

c) Rhapsody 
d) August 2017 

e) September 2026 
f) No 

g) No 

h) Crown Commercial Service (CSS) Framework 
i) Care cube, Mirth, Tquest, EMIS, Blue Cherry ,MESH. MS Exchange, Forcare, Cipha  

Jocap ICS ISCV Ascribe Draeger Mindray OnBase GemWeb Plus Ward Watcher  
ISLA Aqure InTouch With Health Medicus EPRO Cobalt Dose Monitor CIMAR  

Veye CRIS Vue SCM Telepath ICNet Pharm Outcomes Gov UK Notify Sample360  
j) £60,715 

k) Not applicable 

  
Q6 Oncology 

 
a) System type- 

b) Supplier name- 
c) System name- 

d) Date installed- 
e) Contract expiration- 

f) Is this contract annually renewed- 

g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? 
h) Procurement framework 

i) Other systems it integrates with?- 
j) Total value of contract- 

k) Note- e.g. we are currently out to tender- 
  

A6 Information not held- Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital (LHCH) is a specialist adult 

cardiothoracic centre. We do not offer any oncology treatment at LHCH. Patients 



 
requiring Oncology treatment are often referred to Clatterbridge Centre for Oncology.  

 
We advise directing oncology requests to them: 

https://www.clatterbridgecc.nhs.uk/about-centre/access-to-information/freedom-
information-foi 

  

Q7 Pathology 
 

a) System type- 
b) Supplier name- 

c) System name- 
d) Date installed- 

e) Contract expiration- 

f) Is this contract annually renewed- 
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? 

h) Procurement framework 
i) Other systems it integrates with?- 

j) Total value of contract- 
k) Note- e.g. we are currently out to tender- 

  

A7 Information not held- pathology services for the Trust are provided by the Liverpool 
University Hospitals. Please contact them directly at FOIRequests@liverpoolft.nhs.uk. 

  
Q8 Patient Administration System *if your acute trust offers community services, please 

provide details of the PAS and scheduling systems used in both the community and 
acute settings 

 
a) System type- 

b) Supplier name- 

c) System name- 
d) Date installed- 

e) Contract expiration- 
f) Is this contract annually renewed- 

g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? 
h) Procurement framework 

i) Other systems it integrates with?- 

j) Total value of contract- 
k) Note- e.g. we are currently out to tender- 

  
A8 PAS System: 

a) ICS 
b) Alcidion 

c) As per a) and b) 
d) January 2003 

e) March 2025 

f) No 
g) No 

h) No Framework 
i) Care cube, Forcare, Cipha  

Jocap ICS ISCV Ascribe Draeger Mindray OnBase GemWeb Plus Ward Watcher  
ISLA Aqure InTouch With Health Medicus EPRO CRIS SCM Telepath ICNet  

j) £2,252,741 

k) Not applicable 

https://www.clatterbridgecc.nhs.uk/about-centre/access-to-information/freedom-information-foi
https://www.clatterbridgecc.nhs.uk/about-centre/access-to-information/freedom-information-foi
mailto:FOIRequests@liverpoolft.nhs.uk


 
 

Community Services System: 
a) EMIS 

b) EMIS 
c) EMIS WEB 

d) December 2017 

e) December 2024 
f) No 

g) No 
h) NHS SBS  

i) Tquest, Blue Cherry 
j) £574,692 

k) Not applicable 

  
Q9 Pharmacy 

 
a) System type- 

b) Supplier name- 
c) System name- 

d) Date installed- 

e) Contract expiration- 
f) Is this contract annually renewed- 

g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? 
h) Procurement framework 

i) Other systems it integrates with?- 
j) Total value of contract- 

k) Note- e.g. we are currently out to tender- 
  

A9 Stock Control and Dispensing: 

a) EMIS Stock Control 
b) EMIS  

c) Ascribe  
d) 2012   

e) March 2025  
f) No  

g) No  

h) NHS SBS 
i) PAS, Altera EPR, PharmOutcomes  

j) £67,000 
k) Not applicable 

 
Prescribing and Administration: 

a) Part of Trust EPR 
b) Altera 

c) Sunrise Clinical Manager 

d) June 2013 
e) May 2026 

f) No 
g) No 

h) NHS SBS Clinical Information Systems Framework Agreement 
i) PAS, Labs,Radiology, Mindray, Pharmacy Stock control, Drager 

j) Altera Annual Support Cost: £310,712.96 

k) Not applicable 



 
  

Q10 Scheduling * If your acute trust offers community services, please provide details of the 
Patient Administration System (PAS) and Scheduling systems used in both the 

community and acute settings. 
 

a) System type- 

b) Supplier name- 
c) System name- 

d) Date installed- 
e) Contract expiration- 

f) Is this contract annually renewed- 
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? 

h) Procurement framework 

i) Other systems it integrates with?- 
j) Total value of contract- 

k) Note- e.g. we are currently out to tender- 
  

A10 PAS Scheduling System: 
a) ICS Clinical Information System (PAS) 

b) Alcidion UK Ltd 

c) ICS 
d) January 2003 

e) March 2025 
f) No 

g) No 
h) No Framework 

i) Care cube, Forcare, Cipha  
Jocap ICS ISCV Ascribe Draeger Mindray OnBase GemWeb Plus Ward Watcher  

ISLA Aqure InTouch With Health Medicus EPRO CRIS SCM Telepath ICNet  

j) £2,252,741 
k) Not applicable 

 
Community Services Scheduling System: 

a) EMIS 
b) EMIS 

c) EMIS WEB 

d) December 2017 
e) December 2024 

f) No 
g) No 

h) NHS SBS  
i) Tquest, Blue Cherry 

j) £574,692 
k) Not applicable 

  

Q11 Theatres 
 

a) System type- 
b) Supplier name- 

c) System name- 
d) Date installed- 

e) Contract expiration- 

f) Is this contract annually renewed- 



 
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? 

h) Procurement framework 
i) Other systems it integrates with?- 

j) Total value of contract- 
k) Note- e.g. we are currently out to tender- 

  

A11 a-c) Allscripts, Sunrise Clinical Manager Clinical content | Silverlink PAS bookings and  
schedule 

d-e) As per EPR and PAS response 
f) No 

g) No 
h-j) As per EPR and PAS response 

k) Not applicable 

  
Q12 Secondary Care Electronic Prescription Services (EPS) 

a) System type- 
b) Supplier name- 

c) System name- 
d) Date installed- 

e) Contract expiration- 

f) Is this contract annually renewed- 
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? 

h) Procurement framework 
i) Other systems it integrates with?- 

j) Total value of contract- 
k) Note- e.g. we are currently out to tender- 

  
A12 Community Services system only: 

a) EMIS 

b) EMIS 
c) EMIS WEB 

d) December 2017 
e) December 2024 

f) No 
g) No 

h) NHS SBS  

i) Tquest, Blue Cherry 
j) £574,692 

k) Not applicable 
 


