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Subject: Financial Details and Operations of Private Parking Agreements at the Trust
Q1 Financial Revenue and Distribution:

A1

Q2

A2

Q3

A3

a. How much revenue was generated from parking fees charged to NHS staff for the
last financial year?

b. Of this revenue, what percentage or amount was paid to private parking
management companies?

a. £240k was generated from parking fees from LHCH staff in 23/24.

b. We can only provide information regarding what we have charged our own staff —
please see answer A1a above.

Information not held - on site car parking is managed by the Liverpool University
Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust.

You may want to consider re-submitting your request to them on the following
address: FOIRequests@liverpoolft.nhs.uk

Private Companies Profiting:
Can you provide a list of the private parking companies that have benefited from these
arrangements within the last financial year?

Information not held - on site car parking is managed by the Liverpool University
Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust.

You may want to consider re-submitting your request to them on the following address:
FOIRequests@liverpoolft.nhs.uk

Revenue Breakdown:
Please provide a breakdown of the revenue generated from parking fees and fines, per
hospital or area within your trust, for the last financial year.

We can only provide information regarding what we have charged our own staff — please
see answer A1a above. Please note, the Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a single
site Trust.

Information not held - on site car parking is managed by the Liverpool University
Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust.

You may want to consider re-submitting your request to them on the following address:
FOIRequests@liverpoolft.nhs.uk
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