

Reference FOI202324/543

Number:

From: Private Individual

**Date:** 01 March 2024

**Subject:** Complex home care packages

- Q1 Please could you supply the name, email address and telephone number of the commissioner with responsibility for packages of complex home care for adults aged 18 + and children aged 0-18 years old
- A1 Information not held- Complex care packages are commissioned by Local Authority Social Services or NHS Commissioners, not by the Hospital. Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital NHS Foundation Trust is a specialist cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Paediatric Services.
- Q2 Please provide the number of people in receipt of complex home care packages (all active packages during the year including those which started prior) for adults aged 18+ and children aged 0-18 years old
- A2 Information not held- as per A1.
- Q3 Please provide the total number of complex home care hours delivered for adults aged 18+
- A3 Information not held- as per A1.
- Q4 Please provide the total gross expenditure on complex home care packages during the year for adults aged 18+ and children aged 0-18 years old
- A4 Information not held- as per A1.
- Q5 Please provide the lowest, mean, and highest hourly rate for complex home care packages for adults aged 18+
- A5 Information not held- the Trust have no running total of cost at the lowest, mean, or highest rate, and no information on hours delivered due to complex care packages being commissioned by Local Authority Social Services or NHS Commissioners.
- Q6 Please provide the lowest, mean, and highest weekly fee for complex home care packages for adults aged 18+
- A6 Information not held- as per A5.
- Q7 For adults aged 18+ please provide a list of the 10 providers who received the greatest amount of funding for complex home care packages.
  - (i) For each provider, please provide the number of complex home care packages in 2022/23 (all active packages during the year including those which started prior).
  - (ii) For each provider, please provide total expenditure in 2022/23 related to complex



home care.

- A7 Information not held- as per A5.
- Q8 For children aged 0-18 years old please provide a list of the 10 providers who received the greatest amount of funding for complex home care packages.
  - (ii) For each provider, please provide total expenditure in 2022/23 related to complex home care.
  - (ii) For each provider, please provide total expenditure in 2022/23 related to complex home care.
- A8 Information not held- as per A1 and A5.