Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital m

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOI202324/501
Number:
From: Private Individual
Date: 31 January 2024
Subject: Spend for agency useage - on framework/off framework
Q1 For the most recent month available please provide your usage in terms of financial
spend of agency staff for the job types below. Where the information is available,
indicate the percentages ‘on-framework’ and ‘off-framework’.
The job types are:
1. Nursing
2. HCAs
3. Pharmacists
4, Pharmacy Technicians
A1
December
LHCH Staffing group 2023
(excluding Hosted Services) Agency
£'s
Medical 0
Registered Nursing 3000
Scientific, Therapeutic & Technical 66,000
Non-Clinical 0
Total 69,000

All figures provided are ‘on-framework’. We do not use ‘off-framework’ agencies.

Information not held — The Trust does not hold the information in the breakdown that
has been requested. The format above is the only available breakdown of job roles and
categories.



