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Subject: 
 

Consultant doctors headcount/FTE 

 
 
I would be grateful if you could please provide me with the following information for the end of 
each of the following financial years 2017/18, 2018/19 and 2022/23, as well as for the present 
time. 
  
Q1 The total headcount of consultant doctors, the headcount of full-time consultant doctors 

and the headcount of part-time consultant doctors for each of the following specialities 
at your Trust. Please provide figures for each speciality separately and for each year: 

a. Total across all specialities 
b. Accident & Emergency 
c. Cardiology 
d. Ear, Nose & Throat Surgery (Otolaryngology)  
e. Endocrinology or Endocrinology & Diabetes – please specify which.  
f. Ophthalmology 
g. Trauma & Orthopaedics 
h. Urology 

  
A1 a) Please see document: FOI 489 Response 

b) Information not held – we do not have an Accident & Emergency department. 
c) Please see document: FOI 489 Response 
d) Information not held – we do not have an Ear, Nose & Throat department. 
e) Information not held – we do not have an Endocrinology or Endocrinology & 

Diabetes department. 
f) Information not held – we do not have an Ophthalmology department. 
g) Information not held – we do not have a Trauma & Orthopaedics department. 
h) Information not held – we do not have a Urology department. 

 
 

  
Q2 The total full-time equivalent (FTE) consultant doctors for each of the following 

specialities at your Trust. Please provide figures for each speciality separately and for 
each year: 

a. Total across all specialities 
b. Accident & Emergency 
c. Cardiology 
d. Ear, Nose & Throat Surgery (Otolaryngology)  
e. Endocrinology or Endocrinology & Diabetes – please specify which 
f. Ophthalmology 
g. Trauma & Orthopaedics 
h. Urology 

  
A2 a) Please see document: FOI 489 Response 

b) Information not held – we do not have an Accident & Emergency department. 



 
c) Please see document: FOI 489 Response 
d) Information not held – we do not have an Ear, Nose & Throat department. 
e) Information not held – we do not have an Endocrinology or Endocrinology & 

Diabetes department. 
f) Information not held – we do not have an Ophthalmology department. 
g) Information not held – we do not have a Trauma & Orthopaedics department. 
h) Information not held – we do not have a Urology department. 

 



Specialty Heads FTE Heads FTE Heads FTE Heads FTE Heads FTE Heads FTE Heads FTE Heads FTE 
Anaesthetics 20 20 19 19 1 0.7 18 18 19 19 1 0.85
Cardiology 22 22 3 1.35 28 28 3 1.35 37 37 3 2 35 35 3 2
Cardio-thoracic Surgery 21 21 21 20 21 21 2 0.78 22 22 2 0.78
Clinical Radiology 6 6 5 5 1 0.85 9 9 2 1.5 10 10 1 0.6
Community 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1
Oral Surgery 1 0.3 1 0.3
Respiratory Medicine 7 7 7 7 8 8 8 8
Grand Total 77 77 4 1.65 81 80 6 3.2 94 94 7 4.28 95 95 7 4.23

*Data is based on Occupation codes held in ESR.
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