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Q1 Key people for ICT: 
a. Purchasing Manager 
b. Head ICT 
c. Desktops/Notebook Manager 
d. ICT Director 
e. Service Delivery Manager 
f. ICT Project Managers 

  
A1 a. Purchasing Manager- information not held- no such role in the Trust. 

b. Head ICT-Joe McIntyre-joe.mcintyre@alderhey.nhs.uk 
c. Desktops/ Notebook Manager- Information exempt under Section 40: 

Personal Information. Although the information relates to their public role 
and accountability for managing budgets, disclosure of names of all 
individuals may potentially have adverse consequences to the employees. 
Any names of staff that are available in the public domain are accessible 
via our website or previous FOI requests on our disclosure log: 

• https://www.lhch.nhs.uk/ 
• https://www.lhch.nhs.uk/resources/disclosurelogs 
d. ICT director-Leanne Fearnehough-Leanne.Fearnehough@alderhey.nhs.uk 
e. Service Delivery Manager- information not held- no such role in the Trust. 
f. ICT Project Managers- Information exempt under Section 40 Personal 

Information. Although the information relates to their public role and 
accountability for managing budgets, disclosure of names of all individuals 
may potentially have adverse consequences to the employees. Any names 
of staff that are available in the public domain are accessible via our 
website or previous FOI requests on our disclosure log: 

• https://www.lhch.nhs.uk/ 
• https://www.lhch.nhs.uk/resources/disclosurelogs 

 
Q2 What is your annual ICT Spend 2023/2024 
  
A2 £1,600,000 
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