

Reference FOI202324/312

Number:

From: Press/Media

Date: 09 October 2023

Subject: Number of Procedures Cancelled due to Industrial Action

Q1 Please provide me with the following information for all services:

- a. Total number of priority one procedures cancelled due to industrial action or on days of industrial action. Please provide figures by day if possible.
- b. Total number of priority two procedures cancelled due to industrial action or on days of industrial action. Please provide figures by day if possible.
- c. Total number of patients who have had a procedure cancelled twice or more due to industrial action.
- d. Please provide me with the total number of delays to induction of labour on industrial action days
- A1 Please note, we have only included data for inpatient procedures as we do not priority code outpatient procedures.
 - a. Zero
 - b. 60 cancellations for 55 patients.

Split by month:

Month	Number of priority two procedures cancelled
December 2022	4
February 2023	10
March 2023	12
April 2023	10
May 2023	5
June 2023	3
July 2023	6
August 2023	3
September 2023	7
Grand Total	60

- c. 4
- d. Information is not held Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital NHS Foundation Trust is a specialist cardiothoracic centre and does not have a maternity ward or any maternity related services, including Labour and Delivery.
- Q2 Please provide me with the following information for all paediatric services. If you are a specialist children's trust than please provide the details for all services:
 - a. Total number of paediatric surgeries or procedures cancelled due to industrial action. If this code isn't available, please provide me with the number of outpatient appointments cancelled on each strike day.
 - b. Total number of paediatric priority two procedures cancelled due to industrial action. If this code isn't available, please provide me with the number of outpatient appointments cancelled on each strike day.



- c. Total number of paediatric outpatient appointments cancelled due to industrial action. If this code isn't available, please provide me with the number of outpatient appointments cancelled on each strike day.
- d. Total paediatric waiting list including general paediatrics as a speciality and paediatric care within each speciality. (separately)
- A2 a-d: Information not held Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Paediatric services.