Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital m

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOI1202324/291

Number:

From: Commercial

Date: 22 September 2023
Subject: Screening and Immunisation

We are trying to identify the School Aged Immunisation Service team/Screening and
Immunisation Teams.

| would appreciate it if you could provide me with the following for any ages services, Screening
and Immunisation that the Trust provide
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Confirmation of the immunisation or screening service

LHCH has a contract for Occupational Health (OH) service which provides occupational
Immunisations.

There is also an additional service that provides support to administer the flu and covid
vaccinations.

Location of the screening or immunisation service
For OH immunisations, there is a dedicated OH clinic room.

Covid vaccine is administered via a separate clinic area which can also administer flu
vaccine.

Flu vaccine is also administered via a roving model.

Named individuals of the teams and their roles
Immunisation Team Operational Manager
Immunisation Lead Nurse

Immunisation Lead

Programme Lead

Immunisation Programme Lead

School Nurse

Immunisation Coordinator

Lead Nurse for SIT Team

Principal Screening & Immunisation Lead
Local Area Lead

Place Based Lead

I.  Programme Manager

m. Principal Screening & Immunisation Manager

AT T S@moo0oTw

a. Information not held - Immunisations required per role are carried out by our OH
provider.

b. Information not held - Immunisations required per role are carried out by our OH
provider.
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c. Information not held - Immunisations required per role are carried out by our OH
provider.

d. Information not held - Immunisations required per role are carried out by our OH
provider.

e. Information not held - Immunisations required per role are carried out by our OH
provider.

f. Information not held - Immunisations required per role are carried out by our OH
provider.

g. Helen Martin - Head of risk Management for Flu/covid vaccination.

h. Information not held - Immunisations required per role are carried out by our OH
provider.

i. Information not held - Immunisations required per role are carried out by our OH
provider.

j-  Information not held - Immunisations required per role are carried out by our OH
provider.

k. Information not held - Immunisations required per role are carried out by our OH
provider.

I. Information not held - Immunisations required per role are carried out by our OH
provider.

m. Information not held - Immunisations required per role are carried out by our OH
provider.

What type of vaccines are being offered

Occupational Health: Information not held - Immunisations required per role are carried
out by our OH provider.

Flu: Cominarty and Quadrivalent flu vaccines being offered.

Covid: Comirnaty® Original/Omicron BA.4-5 (15/15 micrograms)/dose and Comirnaty®
Omicron XBB.1.5 (30 micrograms/ dose)



