Reference FOI/2019/517

Number:

From: Other

Date: 31 December 2019

**Subject:** Trust Carbon Footprint and Emissions

Q1 Does your Trust measure its total carbon footprint? If so, what is it? Please provide in tCO2e and specify the date of measurement.

- A1 No\*
- Q2 If your Trust has measured its total carbon footprint previously, what was it in:
  - a. 2015-16
  - b. 2016-17
  - c. 2017-18
  - d. 2018-19

Please provide in tCO2e.

- A2 Information not held not known\*
- Q3 How many full-time equivalent (FTE) staff are employed by your Trust?
- A3 1551 FTE
- Q4 Does your Trust have any targets for reducing carbon emissions? If so, please outline.
- A4 Information not held not known\*
- Q5 What percentage of your Trust energy consumption comes from fossil fuels?
- A5 Information not held not known\*
- Q6 Is your Trust taking any steps to reduce its energy consumption from fossil fuels? If so, please outline these steps.
- A6 No\*
- Q7 What percentage of your Trust's vehicle fleet uses:
  - a. Petrol or diesel vehicles
  - b. Hybrid vehicles
  - c. Electric vehicles
- A7 100% petrol or diesel vehicles (one van)
- Q8 Does your Trust have a policy on reducing the use of single-use plastics (including for clinical and/or non-clinical items)? If so, please provide this policy.
- A8 No\*



- Q9 Has your Trust received any funding to spend specifically on sustainability? If so, please provide the details
- A9 No\*

## \*NOTE:

The Trust is part of a bigger estate with another NHS Trust responsible for the provision of energy (Liverpool University Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust) and as such will be a contributor to the NHS climate change act as a whole estate.