

Reference FOI/2019/514

Number:

From: Private Individual

Date: 24 December 2019

Subject: Overseas recruitment

Q1 How much have you spent in each of the last three financial years on travelling abroad and recruitment costs in the selection and recruitment of foreign nurses or other staff for your trust?

For each recruitment exercise please state:

- 1. The number of staff who were sent to the foreign country to facilitate the recruitment drive. Provide a breakdown of staff stating how many were your direct employees and how many were agency staff.
- The total cost to the trust of the recruitment exercise including flights and accommodation.
- 3. The city and country that were visited as part of the exercise, and the dates that they were in the foreign country.
- 4. The type of staff (job description) that it was hoped would be recruited.
- 5. The number of staff from the recruitment drive that were recruited and started work at your Trust.
- A1 2016/17 £12,636 2017/18 - £10,530 2019/20 (to date) - nil
 - 1. Nil no internal staff travelled abroad to facilitate recruitment. Overseas recruitment was undertaken on our behalf by an Agency and we do not hold details if they sent staff abroad to facilitate
 - 2. Information not held
 - 3. Information not held
 - 4. Registered nurses
 - 5. 21