

Reference FOI2021/509

Number:

From: Private Individual

Date: 17 March 2022

Subject: IT Solutions for various clinics

Q1 What IT solutions do you currently use to manage the following Clinic's?

- a. Pre-Assessment
- b. Fracture
- c. Radiology
- d. Oncology
- e. Ophthalmology
- f. Gynecology
- g. Hematology
- h. Neurology
- i. Urology
- A1 a. Allscripts EPR
 - b. Information not held the Trust does not hold this clinic
 - c. Philips Carestream
 - d. Information not held the Trust does not hold this clinic
 - e. Information not held the Trust does not hold this clinic
 - f. Information not held the Trust does not hold this clinic
 - g. Information not held the Trust does not hold this clinic
 - h. Information not held the Trust does not hold this clinic
 - i. Information not held the Trust does not hold this clinic