
 
 
Reference 
Number:  

FOI2021/487 

From: 
 

Commercial 

Date: 
 

01 March 2022 

Subject: 
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Q1 Please could you confirm which, if any, of the following does your organisation hold more 

than 50 user licences:  
a. Salesforce  
b. Pardot  
c. Tableau  
d. Mulesoft  
e. Slack  
f. Ncino  
g. Vlocity  

  
A1 Information not held – The Trust does not hold any of the above licences. 
  
 


