

Reference FOI202223/482

Number:

From: Other

Date: 13 March 2023

Subject: Agency staff spend 2020,2021,2022

- Q1 What was your trust spend on agency for the period 1 January 2022 to 31 December 2022 inclusive for the following staff groups:
 - a. Registered nurse (RN)
 - b. Health care support workers/healthcare assistants/nursing associates?
- A1 a. £112,391.71
 - b. Information not held no agency Health care support workers/healthcare assistants/nursing associates only Registered Nurses used.
- Q2 What was your trust spend on agency for the period 1 January 2021 to 31 December 2021 inclusive for the following staff groups:
 - a. Registered nurse (RN)
 - b. Health care support workers/healthcare assistants/nursing associates?
- A2 a. £212,131.45
 - b. Information not held no agency Health care support workers/healthcare assistants/nursing associates only Registered Nurses used.
- What was your trust spend on agency for the period 1 January 2020 to 31 December 2020 inclusive for the following staff groups:
 - a. Registered nurse (RN)
 - b. Health care support workers/healthcare assistants/nursing associates?
- A3 a. £201,234.09
 - b. Information not held no agency Health care support workers/healthcare assistants/nursing associates only Registered Nurses used.