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Number:  

FOI2021/479 

From: 
 

Private Individual 

Date: 
 

24 February 2022 

Subject: 
 

Contracts and spend for printers 

 
 
 We are currently updating data on your Trust's printing devices (infrastructure hardware) 

and would appreciate your help. Can you please complete the fields below with what 
you currently hold? 

  
Q1 Standard Printers 

a. Number of printers:  
b. Main supplier:  
c. Contract end date:  
d. Annual spend £'s 2020-21:  

  
A1 a. 20 

b. Konica 
c. 28/06/2023 
d. Information not held – No breakdown is available for different printer types, 

however the total spend for 2020-21 with Konica was £49,868. 
  
Q2 MFD Printers  

a. Number of printers:  
b. Main supplier:  
c. Contract end date:  
d. Annual spend £'s 2020-21:  

  
A2 a. 59 

b. Konica 
c. 28/06/2023 
d. Information not held – as per A1d 

  

 


