
 
 
Reference 
Number:  

FOI2021/477 

From: 
 

Private Individual 

Date: 
 

24 February 2022 

Subject: 
 

Contracts for temporary patient accomodation 

 
 
Q1 How many sides rooms/single patient rooms do you have? 
  
A1 84 general side rooms plus 11 Critical Care side rooms 
  
Q2 Do you, or have you ever used temporary pod/side rooms as part of your IPC 

measures? 
  
A2 No 
  
Q3 What company did you use and how many were procured? 
  
A3 Information not held – Not applicable as per A2 
  
Q4 Were these purchased, rented or leased? 
  
A4 Information not held – Not applicable as per A2 
  
Q5 Under contract for rental and maintenance? 
  
A5 Information not held – Not applicable as per A2 
  
Q6 Are your buildings under a PFI contract and if so who? 
  
A6 No 
  
Q7 Could you provide me with the contact details of the person/s responsible for the fields 

below? 
a. Infection Control 
b. Estates  
c. Procurement 
d. Capital Projects 
e. Fire Officers 
f. Ventilation Manager 

  
A7 a. Nicola Best – Infection Prevention Nurse Specialist Nicola.Best@lhch.nhs.uk  

b. Adam Hope – Head of Estates Adam.Hope@lhch.nhs.uk  
c. Steven Doran – Head of Procurement Steven.Doran@lhch.nhs.uk  
d. Dave Macmillan – Senior Estates Manager and Capital Projects Manager 

Dave.Macmillan@lhch.nhs.uk  
e. Liam Telford – Fire Safety Advisor Liam.Telford@lhch.nhs.uk  
f. As per A7b 
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Reference 
Number:  

FOI2021/478 

From: 
 

Commercial 

Date: 
 

24 February 2022 

Subject: 
 

Audits performed of patient urinary cathetarisation 
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