
 
 
Reference 
Number:  

FOI202223/459 

From: 
 

Private Individual 

Date: 
 

21 February 2023 

Subject: 
 

Names of managers within Theatres 

 
 
 The name and email address of the person within your Trust that holds the following role 

/ responsibilities. 

  

Q1 a. Pre–Operative Manager 
b. Pre-Operative Director 
c. Pre-Operative Assessment Manager 
d. Head of Pre-Operative Assessment 
e. Head of Theatre Services 
f. Head of Surgery services 
g. Post Operative Manager 
h. Post Operative Director 
i. Head of Post Operative care / discharge 
j. Ward Manger of Post Operative 

  
A1 a. Information not held - No specific role 

b. Information not held - No specific role 
c. Information not held - No specific role 
d. Annie Joseph Matron Outpatients Manager – Annie.Joseph@lhch.nhs.uk 
e. Pat Routledge, Business Manager Surgery – Pat.Routledge@lhch.nhs.uk 
f. Lucy Currie, Divisional Director of Operations Surgery – Lucy.Currie@lhch.nhs.uk 
g. Information not held - No specific role 
h. Information not held - No specific role 
i. Information not held - No specific role 
j. Oak Ward (Thoracic Post-Op) – Katie Mulhearn – Katie.Mulhearn@lhch.nhs.uk, 

Cedar Ward (Cardiac Post-Op) – Caroline Rowlands – 
Caroline.Rowlands@lhch.nhs.uk 

  
 


