Reference
Number:
From:
Date:

Subject:

Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital m

NHS Foundation Trust

FOI1202223/448
Private Individual
14 February 2023

Trust system details

Q1 System type — Clinical decision support in e-prescribing
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Supplier name

System name

Date installed

Contract expiration

Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No

Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No
Procurement framework

Other systems it integrates with?

Total value of contract (£)

Altera

Sunrise Clinical Manager

May 2012

May 2025

No

No

None

Information not held — integrates with no other systems
£1,211,547.38 over 3 years

Q2 System name -Observations — vital signs
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Date installed

Contract expiration

Is this contract annually renewed? — Yes/No

Do you currently have plans to replace this system? — Yes/No
Procurement framework

Other systems it integrates with?

Total value of contract (£)

May 2012

May 2025

No

No

None

Mindray Obs Machines
As per A1i

Q3 System type — Oncology e-prescribing



A3

Q4

A4
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Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital MIB

NHS Foundation Trust

Supplier name

System name

Date installed

Contract expiration

Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No

Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No
Procurement framework

Other systems it integrates with?

Total value of contract (£)

Information not held — Not currently used

System type — Diagnostic imaging
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Supplier name

System name

Date installed

Contract expiration

Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No

Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No
Procurement framework

Other systems it integrates with?

Total value of contract (£)

i.  Phillips PACS
ii. Wellbeing CRIS

As per A4 i-ii

i. June 2013
i. Jan 2013

i. June 2023
i. June 2027

QE Facilities - Clinical IT Software (and Hardware) Solutions for use in
Healthcare.

ii.  QE Facilities - Clinical IT Software (and Hardware) Solutions for use in
Healthcare

. All interact with each other.

i.  £1,175,632 excl. VAT
ii. £306,485 exc. VAT



