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Reference FOI12021/435

Number:

From: Other

Date: 14 January 2022

Subject: Names of individuals in Trust Leadership roles

Q1 Please could you provide us with details for the below leadership roles.

A1

a. Confirm whether the individuals mentioned in the table are correct in their specific

roles.

b. Provide details for the missing ones. In case if the position is vacant please

mention so.

c. If you have a very similar role but not the exact job title, please include details of
the very similar role and individual. If you don't have this role at all, please state

N/A or “Don’t have the job title”.

Liverpool Heart and Chest

UG LETTE Hospital Foundation Trust
Profile Type Specialist
Organisation Code RBQ

Chair Neil Large

Chief Executive Jane Tomkinson

Chief Finance Officer Karen Edge

Medical Director

Raphael Perry

Director of Nursing

Sue Pemberton

Chief Operating Officer

Jonathan Mathews

Director of Communications and Marketing

This falls under the remit of Director
of Corporate Affairs

Director of HR and OD

This falls under the remit of Chief
People Officer

Chief People Officer

Karen Nightingall

Director of Strategy and Planning

Jonathan Develing

Chief Pharmacist

Danny Forrest

Director of Corporate Affairs

Lucy Lavan

Head of Legal Services

This falls under the remit of the Risk
and Safety Lead — Helen Martin

Lead Director for Procurement (procurement
director)

This falls under the remit of Chief
Finance Officer

PA to Chief Executive

Megan Underwood

Chief Clinical Information Officer

This falls under the remit of the
Medical Director

Director of Infection Control

This falls under the remit of Medical
Director

Head of Estates

Adam Hope

Chief Digital and Information Officer

Kate Warriner
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Information not held — The Trust

Head of Hotel Services does not have a Hotel Services
Team
Information not held — The Trust
Head of Private Patients does not have a dedicated Head of

Private Patients

Information not held — The Trust
Head of Sterile Services does not have a Sterile Services
Department

Head of Facilities Management Sharon Hindley




