

Reference

FOI202223/421

Number: From:

Private Individual

Date:

26 January 2023

Subject:

Recruitment details of non-medical non-clinical staff

Information requested coving the last 12 months, or the most recent 12 month period recorded.

- Q1 Has the Trust used agencies to recruit temporary non-medical non-clinical staff?
  - a. If so, please confirm the total agency spend on non-medical non-clinical temporary staff?
  - b. Please provide a breakdown of your answer to question 1a, splitting the spend by job title/specialism.

## A1 Yes

- a. £136,102 for Administration and Clerical Agency temporary staff from January 2022 to December 2022.
- b. Information not held the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data.
- Q2 Has the Trust used agencies to recruit permanent non-medical non-clinical staff?
  - a. If so, please confirm the total agency spend on non-medical non-clinical permanent staff?
  - b. Please provide a breakdown of your answer to question 2a, splitting the spend by job title/specialism.
- A2 Information not held The Trust has not used agencies to recruit permanent non-medical non-clinical staff
- Q3 The contact name of the person responsible for dealing with non-medical non-clinical permanent recruitment?
- A3 Information not held This under the responsibility of local managers
- Q4 The contact name of the person responsible for dealing with non-medical non-clinical temporary recruitment?
- A4 Information not held This under the responsibility of local managers