

Reference FOI2021/412

Number:

From: Private Individual

Date: 09 December 2021

**Subject:** Deaths due to covid-19 from 01/12/2019 to 30/11/2021

- Q1 a. How many people have died in your hospitals within 28 days of testing positive for COVID-19?
  - b. Of those people, how many had underlying health conditions / co-morbidities and how many did not? Please provide absolute numbers and percentages.
  - c. Please also state the top 5 underlying health conditions / co-morbidities of those people.
  - d. Please state how many of those people were vaccinated and how many were not. Please provide absolute numbers and percentages. For vaccinated people, please break down the response in the following way: i) received one dose, ii) received two or more doses.

## A1 a. 46

- b. Information not held the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data.
- c. Information not held the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data.
- d. Information not held the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data.
- Q2 a. How many people have died in your hospitals purely and only due to COVID-19?
  - b. Of those people, how many had underlying health conditions / co-morbidities and how many did not? Please provide absolute numbers and percentages.
  - c. Please also state the top 5 underlying health conditions / co-morbidities of those people.
  - d. Please state how many of those people were vaccinated and how many were not. Please provide absolute numbers and percentages. For vaccinated people, please break down the response in the following way: i) received one dose, ii) received two or more doses.

## A2 a. Seven

- b. Information not held the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data.
- c. Information not held the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data.
- d. Information not held the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data.

