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 Gastroenterology 
Q1 Do you currently have endoscopy reporting software installed? 

a. If yes, who is the provider of this software? 
  
Q2 Do you currently have any software installed to support the tracking of long term 

gastroenterology patients (eg. IBD patients)? 
a. If yes, who is the provider of this software? 

  
A1- 
A2 

Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult 
cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Gastroenterology services 
 

 Urology 
Q3 Do you currently have cystoscopy reporting software installed? 

a. If yes, who is the provider of this software? 
  
A3 Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult 

cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Urology services 
 

 Respiratory 
Q4 Do you currently have bronchoscopy reporting software installed? 

a. If yes, who is the provider of that software? 
  
A4 No, bronchoscopies are currently recorded on the Electronic Patient Record 

a. Allscripts 
  
Q5 Do you currently have a procedure documentation process in place within pulmonology?  

a. If is yes, who is the provider of this documentation 
  
A5 No 
  
Q6 Do you have the ability to capture images within this dept? 

a. If so what do you use? 
  
A6 Yes 

a. Pentax – via print recorder or pen drive 
 

 Multifunctional software  
Q7 Do you currently have order communications software installed? 

a. If yes, who is the provider of this software? 
  
A7 Yes 



 
a. Allscripts 

  
Q8 Do you currently have a patient administration system installed? 

a. If yes, who is the provider of this software? 
  
A8 Yes 

a. Silverlink 
  
Q9 Do you currently have any business intelligence systems installed? 

a. If yes, who is the provider of this software? (If there is more than one provider for 
different departments please include each provider and the dept) 

  
A9 Yes 

a. Microsoft Power BI 
  
Q10 Do you currently have an integration platform installed? 

a. If yes, who is the provider of this software? 
  
A10 Yes 

a. Rhapsody 
  
Q11 Do you currently have an electronic document and records management solution 

installed? -EHR 
a. If yes, who is the provider of this software? 

  
A11 Yes 

a. Emis (for community records), Allscripts (for hospital records) 
  
Q12 Do you have an Electronic Nursing Record ENR – procedure documentation within the 

Trust 
a. If so which departments, do you use this in? 

  
A12 Yes 

a. Allscripts 
 

 Orthopaedics  
Q13 Do you currently have any IT systems in place within Orthopaedics? 

a. If yes, who is the provider of this software? 
  
A13 Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult 

cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Orthopaedic services 
 

 Pharmacy  
Q14 Do you currently have a pharmacy stock management system installed? 

a. If yes, who is the provider of this software? 
  
A14 Yes 

a. EMIS (Ascribe) 
  
Q15 Do you currently have an eprescribing solution installed? 

a. If yes, who is the provider of this software? 
  
A15 Yes 



 
a. Allscripts 

  
Q16 Do you have a pharmacy management module that allows pharmacists to generate 

chemotherapy treatments quickly and accurately?  
a. If so does it have dosage control monitoring the ongoing therapy? 

  
A16 Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult 

cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Chemotherapy treatments. 
 

 Cardiology 
Q17 Within your cardiology depts do you have an image management and procedure 

documentation solution?  
a. If yes – how long has it been in place & what software are you using? 

  
A17 Yes 

a. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 
‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   

 
This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2021 
Disclosure Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 388: 
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-
information/disclosure-logs/  

 
Enter the year into the Category field and reference number into the Title field then click Search. 
Select Download to open.  
 

 General Surgery  
Q18 Do you use a workflow management and procedure documentation solution within 

general surgery?  
a. If yes- what do you use and does it capture images? 

  
A18 Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult 

cardiothoracic centre and does not provide General Surgery 
 

 Pain Management  
Q19 What system do you use to document pain management? 
  
A19 Allscripts 

 
 OB/GYN 
Q20 Within your OB/GYN do you currently have systems in place for procedure 

documentation. 
  
Q21 How do you manage departmental workflow? 
  
Q22 Do you use a data management application? 
  
A20-
A22 

Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult 
cardiothoracic centre and does not provide OB/GYN services 

  
 ENT 
Q23 Do you currently have reporting software installed? 

If yes, who is the provider of that software? 

http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-information/disclosure-logs/
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-information/disclosure-logs/


 
  
Q24 Do you currently have a procedure documentation process in place within ENT?  

If yes, who is the provider of this documentation 
  
Q25 Do you have the ability to capture images within this dept? 

20.5. If so what do you use? 
  
A23-
A25 

Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult 
cardiothoracic centre and does not provide ENT services 

  
 Pathology 
Q26 Do you currently have a histopathology reporting management system and does it offer 

image capture of samples/cultures? 
  
A26 Information not held – pathology services for the Trust are provided by the Liverpool 

University Hospitals. Please contact them directly at FOIRequests@liverpoolft.nhs.uk 

 


