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Number:  

FOI2021/387 

From: 
 

Commercial 

Date: 
 

26 November 2021 

Subject: 
 

PAS and EPR Suppliers and costs 

 
Q1 a. What is the name of your PAS supplier? 

b. How much does this cost per annum? 
c. What is the length of your contract for this service? 
d. What is the total cost of your contract? 
e. When does this contract expire? 

  
A1 a. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 

This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2021 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 362: 
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-
information/disclosure-logs/  

 
Enter the year into the Category field and reference number into the Title field then click Search. 
Select Download to open.  

 
b. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 

This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2020 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 104: 
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-
information/disclosure-logs/  

 
Enter the year into the Category field and reference number into the Title field then click Search. 
Select Download to open.  

 
c. 8 years 
 
d. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 

This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2020 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 104: 
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-
information/disclosure-logs/  

 
Enter the year into the Category field and reference number into the Title field then click Search. 
Select Download to open.  

 
e. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
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This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2021 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 362: 
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-
information/disclosure-logs/  

 
Enter the year into the Category field and reference number into the Title field then click Search. 
Select Download to open.  

  
Q2 a. What is the name of your EPR supplier? (If you do not have an EPR simply state 

“None”). 
b. How much per does this cost per annum? 
c. What is the length of your contract for this service? 
d. What is the total cost of your contract? 
e. When does this contract expire? 

  
A2 a. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 

This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2020 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 295: 
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-
information/disclosure-logs/  

 
Enter the year into the Category field and reference number into the Title field then click Search. 
Select Download to open.  

 
b. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 

This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2020 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 104: 
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-
information/disclosure-logs/  

 
Enter the year into the Category field and reference number into the Title field then click Search. 
Select Download to open.  

 
c. 8 years 
 
d. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 

This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2020 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 104: 
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-
information/disclosure-logs/  

 
Enter the year into the Category field and reference number into the Title field then click Search. 
Select Download to open.  

 
e. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 

This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2020 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 295: 
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http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-
information/disclosure-logs/  

 
Enter the year into the Category field and reference number into the Title field then click Search. 
Select Download to open. 

  
Q3 a. Does your trust run community services? (e.g.: District Nursing) (If no, simply state 

“No”). 
b. If so, what is the name of your PAS/EPR supplier? 
c. How much does this cost per annum? 
d. What is the length of your contract for this service? 
e. What is the total cost of your contract? 
f. When does this contract expire? 

  
A3 a. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 

This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2020 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 104: 
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-
information/disclosure-logs/  

 
Enter the year into the Category field and reference number into the Title field then click Search. 
Select Download to open. 

 
b. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 

This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2020 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 104: 
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-
information/disclosure-logs/  

 
Enter the year into the Category field and reference number into the Title field then click Search. 
Select Download to open.  

 
c. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 

This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2020 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 104: 
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-
information/disclosure-logs/  

 
Enter the year into the Category field and reference number into the Title field then click Search. 
Select Download to open.  

 
d. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 

This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2020 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 104: 
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-
information/disclosure-logs/  
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Enter the year into the Category field and reference number into the Title field then click Search. 
Select Download to open.  

 
e. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 - 

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.   
 

This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2020 Disclosure 
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 104: 
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-
information/disclosure-logs/  

 
Enter the year into the Category field and reference number into the Title field then click Search. 
Select Download to open. 

  
Q4 a. Does your Trust have an electronic prescribing and medicines administration 

system?  
b. If so, who is the supplier of your ePMA system?  
c. How much does your ePMA system cost per annum?  
d. What is the total cost of the ePMA contract, over the life?  
e. What is the length of your contract for this service?  
f. When does your current contract expire? 

  
A4 a. Information not held - ePMA is part of the EPR solution. 

b. Information not held, as per A4 above 
c. Information not held, as per A4 above 
d. Information not held, as per A4 above 
e. Information not held, as per A4 above 
f. Information not held, as per A4 above 
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