

Reference FOI/2019/342

Number:

From: Private Individual

Date: 19 August 2019

Subject: Heads of Department contact names

Q1 Please could you assist me with the following information:

The name, job title and email of the head of department for the following services:

- 1. Endocrinology
- 2. Ophthalmology
- 3. Audiology
- 4. Urology
- 5. Dermatology
- 6. Oncology
- 7. Pulmonology
- 1. Information not held Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital (LHCH) is a specialist adult cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Endocrinology services
 - 2. Information not held LHCH is a specialist adult cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Ophthalmology services
 - 3. Information not held LHCH is a specialist adult cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Audiology services
 - 4. Information not held LHCH is a specialist adult cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Urology services
 - 5. Information not held –LHCH is a specialist adult cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Dermatology services
 - 6. Information not held LHCH is a specialist adult cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Oncology service
 - 7. Information not held LHCH does not have a Pulmonology Department; responsibilities however will either fall within the remit of our Clinical Lead for Respiratory or the Manager of our Respiratory Diagnostics / Pulmonary Function Department:
 - Dr Martin Ledson, Clinical Lead for Respiratory Medicine, Martin.Ledson@lhch.nhs.uk
 - Dot Price, Manager Respiratory Diagnostics / Pulmonary Function <u>Dorothy.Price@lhch.nhs.uk</u>