

Reference FOI/2019/340

Number:

From: Private Individual

Date: 15 August 2019

Subject: Green spaces

Q1 I would be grateful if you could send me

- 1. The total of trust owned green space(s) available in 2019 in m2.
- 2. The total of trust owned green space(s) available in 2009 in m2.
- 3. What was the trusts total greenhouse gas emissions output (CO2e) in 2018/19, and the percentage change against 2008/9.
- A1 1. Information not held
 - 2. Information not held
 - 3. Information not held