

Reference FOI202223/333

Number:

From: Press/Media

Date: 08 December 2022

**Subject:** Details of which services were closed due to maintenance or repair works.

Q1 The total duration (in days or hours) for which services were closed due to **maintenance or repair works**.

Please can you provide the data with the following breakdowns:

- a. Yearly for the financial years 2022-23, 2021-22, 2020-21, 2019-20, 2018-19, 2017-18, 2016-17, 2015-16, 2014-15, 2013-14, 2012-13.
- b. The impacted site.
- c. The impacted service area (e.g. surgery, outpatient, inpatient etc.).
- d. The total number of cancelled services due to this.
- A1 Information not held the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data.
- Q2 The total duration (in days or hours) for which services were closed due to **estates and infrastructure failures** (e.g. damages, equipment deficiencies).

Please can you provide the data with the following breakdowns:

- a. Yearly for the financial years 2022-23, 2021-22, 2020-21, 2019-20, 2018-19, 2017-18, 2016-17, 2015-16, 2014-15, 2013-14, 2012-13.
- b. The impacted site.
- c. The impacted service area (e.g. surgery, outpatient, inpatient etc.).
- d. The total number of cancelled services due to this.
- A2 Information not held the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information centrally as part of its management or performance data.