Reference FOI/2019/326

Number:

From: Commercial

Date: 07 August 2019

Subject: Operating theatres 2015 and 2018

- Q1 Number of hospitals in your trust with at least one Operating Theatre (facility within a hospital where surgical operations are carried out):
 - a. In 2015
 - b. In 2018
- A1 a. One
 - b. One
- Q2 Total number of operating theatres in your trust
 - a. In 2015
 - b. In 2018
- A2 a. Eight
 - b. Eight
- Q3 Total number of Hybrid operating theatres (surgical theatre that equipped with advanced medical imaging devices, CT, MRI, Fluoroscopy, etc.) in your trust
 - a. In 2015
 - b. In 2018
- A3 a. One
 - b. One
- Total number of service-integrated operating theatres ("integrated" refering to functionally connecting the OR environment including patient information, audio, video, surgical lights and room lights, building automation (HVAC), and medical equipment.) in your trust:
 - a. In 2015
 - b. In 2018
- A4 a. None
 - b. None
- Q5 How many Operating Theatres with service integrated systems are currently under construction?
 - a. In 2015
 - b. In 2018
- A5 a. None
 - b. None
- Q6 How many hospitals in your trust are closing down?
 - a. In 2015

	b. In 2018
A6	a. None b. None
Q7	How many operating theatres in your trust have Video Lifecycle Management? a. In 2015 b. In 2018
A7	a. None b. None
Q8	Average Lifespan (years) of Video Lifecycle Management? a. In 2015 b. In 2018
A8	a. & b. Information not held – not applicable
Q9	Average Number of connected recording systems in your operating theatres: a. In 2015 b. In 2018
A9	a. & b. Information not held – not applicable
Q10	Number of operating theatres in your trust with UCES only a. In 2015 b. In 2018
A10	a. None b. None
Q11	Number of operating theatres in your trust with UCES and EasySuite 4K a. In 2015 b. In 2018
A11	a. None b. None
Q12	Number of operating theatres in your trust with UCES and EasySuite 4K and MedPresence a. In 2015 b. In 2018
A12	a. None b. None
Q13	Number of operating theatres in your trust with EasySuite 4K only a. In 2015 b. In 2018
A13	a. None

b. None

Number of operating theatres in your trust with EasySuite 4K only Q14 a. In 2015 b. In 2018 a. None A14 b. None Number of operating theatres in your trust with UCES and MedPresence Q15 In 2015 In 2018 b. A15 a. None b. None Q16 Number of operating theatres in your trust with MedPresence Standalone a. In 2015 b. b. In 2018

a. None

b. None

A16