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How many patients are on the endoscopy waiting list?
Do you use any insourcing companies for the following?

I.  Gastroenterology Outpatients clinics

ii. Diagnostic Procedures
Do you have an active contract with any providers, please list the name of the
providers?
Please list the length of contracts
How are these contracts awarded? (Tender, Direct award or no process)
How is this charged for by the third-party service provider per patient/per
tariff/sessional

. Are you currently being charged below, on or above NHS tariff?

What are the average and maximum number of JAG points completed per list (i.e. per
endoscopist per day)?

Does a floor price apply to the contract? If so, on how many occasions has the floor
price per room per day charge been applied?

The total number of procedures completed by each supplier

The total spends completed by each supplier

How many endoscopy rooms do you have in your trust?

. Please can you provider the contact information for your service delivery or general

managers for endoscopy

Please give an annual breakdown per annum of insourcing services per service area:
i. 18/19
ii. 19/20

Six
Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 -

‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.

This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2020 Disclosure
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 265:
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-
information/disclosure-logs/

Enter the year into the Category field and reference number into the Title field then click Search.
Select Download to open.

No

Not Applicable, as per A1C above


http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-information/disclosure-logs/
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-information/disclosure-logs/
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E. Not Applicable, as per A1C above
F. Not Applicable, as per A1C above
G. Not Applicable, as per A1C above
H. Not Applicable, as per A1C above
I. Not Applicable, as per A1C above
J. Not Applicable, as per A1C above
K. Not Applicable, as per A1C above
L. One

M. Information exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 -
‘Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means’.

This information is available on our website, it can be found in our 2020 Disclosure
Log, please see FOI Request Ref: 265:
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-
information/disclosure-logs/

Enter the year into the Category field and reference number into the Title field then click Search.
Select Download to open.

N. Information not held — we do not use insourcing services for Endoscopy.

Urology Surgery
A. How many patients are on the urology waiting list?
B. Do you use any insourcing companies for the following?
I.  Urology Outpatients Surgical clinics
ii.  Urology Diagnostic and therapeutic surgical Procedures
C. Do you have an active contract with any providers, please list the name of the
providers?
Please list the length of contracts
How are these contracts awarded? (Tender, Direct award or no process)
How is this charged for by the third-party service provider per patient/per
tariff/sessional
. Are you currently being charged below, on or above NHS tariff?
Does a floor price apply to the contract? If so, on how many occasions has the floor
price per room per day charge been applied?
The total number of procedures completed by each supplier
The total spends completed by each supplier
Please can you provider the contact information for your service delivery or general
managers for Urology services
L. Please give an annual breakdown per annum of insourcing services per service area:
. 18/19
ii. 19/20
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o

Ao -

Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult


http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-information/disclosure-logs/
http://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/information-governance/freedom-of-information/disclosure-logs/
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cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Urology Surgery.

Ophthalmology Surgery
A. How many patients are on the ophthalmology waiting list?
B. Do you use any insourcing companies for the following?
i.  Ophthalmology Outpatients Surgical clinics
ii.  Ophthalmology Diagnostic and therapeutic surgical Procedures
C. Do you have an active contract with any providers, please list the name of the
providers?
Please list the length of contracts
How are these contracts awarded? (Tender, Direct award or no process)
How is this charged for by the third-party service provider per patient/per
tariff/sessional
. Are you currently being charged below, on or above NHS tariff?
Does a floor price apply to the contract? If so, on how many occasions has the floor
price per room per day charge been applied?
The total number of procedures completed by each supplier
The total spends completed by each supplier
Please can you provider the contact information for your service delivery or general
managers for Ophthalmology services
L. Please give an annual breakdown per annum of insourcing services per service area:
. 18/19
ii. 19/20

nmo

o

Ao -

Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult
cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Ophthalmology Surgery.

Dermatology Surgery
A. How many patients are on the dermatology waiting list?
B. Do you use any insourcing companies for the following?
I.  Dermatology Outpatients Surgical clinics
ii. Dermatology Diagnostic and therapeutic surgical Procedures
C. Do you have an active contract with any providers, please list the name of the
providers?
Please list the length of contracts
How are these contracts awarded? (Tender, Direct award or no process)
How is this charged for by the third-party service provider per patient/per
tariff/sessional
. Are you currently being charged below, on or above NHS tariff?
Does a floor price apply to the contract? If so, on how many occasions has the floor
price per room per day charge been applied?
The total number of procedures completed by each supplier
The total spends completed by each supplier
Please can you provider the contact information for your service delivery or general
managers for Dermatology services
L. Please give an annual breakdown per annum of insourcing services per service area:
i. 18/19
ii. 19/20
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Information not held - Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult
cardiothoracic centre and does not provide Dermatology Surgery.



