

Reference FOI/2019/309

Number:

A1

From: Commercial

Date: 30 July 2019

Subject: Supplier details (departments & systems)- In & Outpatients; Theatre;

Pharmacy; Vital observations; bed management; BI & data warehouse;

Finance; EPR; Benchmarking

Q1 Please can you supply the following information regarding the below systems?

- 1. A&E: system name / supplier
- 2. Inpatients: system name / supplier
- 3. Outpatients: system name / supplier
- 4. Theatres: system name / supplier
- 5. Pharmacy: system name / supplier
- 6. Vital Observation: system name / supplier
- 7. Bed Management: system name / supplier
- 8. Patient Flow: system name / supplier
- 9. Command Center / Site Office: system name / supplier
- 10. Data Warehouse: system name / supplier
- 11. Business Intelligence: system name / supplier
- 12. Finance Invoice / Tariff: system name / supplier
- 13. Finance PLICS: system name / supplier
- 14. Electronic Patient Record (EPR): system name / supplier
- 15. Bench-marking tool: system name / supplier
- 16. Room Booking system: system name / supplier
- 17. Staff Rota system (other than ESR): system name / supplier
- Information not held Information not held Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital is a specialist adult cardiothoracic centre and does not provide
 - 2. Silverlink, ICS & Allscripts, Sunrise Clinical Manager
 - 3. Silverlink, ICS & Allscripts, Sunrise Clinical Manager
 - 4. Allscripts, Sunrise Clinical Manager Clinical content | Silverlink PAS bookings and schedule
 - 5. Hospital Pharmacy, EMIS Health
 - 6. Allscripts, Sunrise Clinical Manager and Mindray observation devises
 - 7. Silverlink, ICS
 - 8. Information not held not applicable, flow management is part of Bed Management solution
 - 9. Information not held not applicable, digital command centre is to be reviewed over the next 2 years. Hospital Co-Ordinator hub is the central point of Trust operations
 - 10. Microsoft SQL Server stack
 - 11. Microsoft SQL Server stack
 - 12. Civica SLAM
 - 13. ProDaCapo Costing
 - 14. Allscripts, Sunrise Clinical Manager
 - 15. Dr Foster, Dr Foster Intelligence
 - 16. Microsoft Outlook
 - 17. Allocate, HealthRoster Suite

