Reference FOI202223/294

Number:

From: Commercial

Date: 08 November 2022

**Subject:** Structure details for IT

- Q1 Could you please provide me with up-to-date names, job titles and email addresses for your Senior IT staff, such as:
  - a. Chief Information Officer
  - b. Chief Digital Officer
  - c. Chief Technology Officer
  - d. Head of Digital Transformation
  - e. Director of IT / ICT / IM&T / Digital / Information / Technology
  - f. Head of IT / ICT / IM&T / Digital / Information / Technology
  - g. IT / ICT / IM&T / Digital / Information / Technology Manager
  - h. Chief / Deputy Operating Officer
  - i. Head / Director of Cyber Security
  - j. ICT Project Manager
  - k. ICT Programme Manager
  - I. Network Manager / Head / Director
  - m. ICT Infrastructure
  - n. ICT Business Manager
  - o. Head of IT Procurement
  - p. ICT Officer
  - q. ICT Network Officer
- A1 a. No such role, this falls under the remit of our Chief Digital and Information Officer– Kate Warriner, Kate.Warriner@lhch.nhs.uk
  - b. As per A1 a.
  - c. Information not held No such role
  - d. Assistant Chief Information Officer/Data and Change Ian Gilbertson, Ian.Gilbertson@lhch.nhs.uk
  - e. As per A1 a.
  - f. Head of IT- Joe McIntyre, Joe.McIntyre@alderhey.nhs.uk
  - g. Information not held No such role
  - h. Chief Operating Officer Jonathan Mathews, Jonathan.Mathews@lhch.nhs.uk
  - i. Cyber Security Manager Paul Grimes, Paul.Grimes@lhch.nhs.uk
  - j. Digital Programme Manager Leila Brown, Leila.Brown@lhch.nhs.uk
  - k. As per A1 j.
  - I. Head of Data Engineering Beverley Gerrard, Beverley.Gerrard@lhch.nhs.uk
  - m. As per A1 I.
  - n. Information not held No such role
  - o. Procurement and Contract Manager Richard Jolley, Richard.jolley@nhs.net
  - p. Information not held No such role
  - q. Information not held No such role