Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital m

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOI12021/294

Number:

From: Commercial

Date: 23 August 2021

Subject: Cost of Construction projects since 2010

Q1 In reference to the Trusts expenditure and estate, can you please provide details of the

Q2
Q3

Al-
A3

following:
Identification of all construction projects (classified specifically as a refurbishment or new
build) within your estate since 2010, where the project value exceeded £1m

Project cost (cost accuracy to the nearest £m) and the year of completion

Confirmation of the trust appointed project team (organisation name only), namely:
a. Selected Contractor
b. Architect
c. Structural Engineer
d. M&E Engineer

Please see attached spreadsheet — Construction Projects FOI12021294

Information not held — Data not held for projects prior to 2016 in line with records
retention guidelines.



[Truse________________|Project Title Year of Completion __|Budget/Cost_(¢M) Structural Engincer M&E Engincer

Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital

NHS Foundation Trust Scanner Building Works 2020 £2m John Turner Construction Group Ltd Day Architects MDA Consulting Engineers Mercury Consulting Engineers
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