Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital m

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOI1202223/286
Number:
From: Private Individual
Date: 04 November 2022
Subject: Details of contract register
Q1 The FULL contract register should display all the organisations existing/live contracts |
would like the register to display the following columns/headings:
a. Contract Reference -Unique reference number associated with the contract.
b. Contract Title
c. Procurement Category —Please state the category name of the contract, | wish to
know the category the contract is under
d. Supplier Name
e. Spend (Total, Annual or contract value)
f. Contract’s Duration
g. Contract’s Extensions
h. Contract’s Start Date
i. Contract’s Expiry Date
j- Contract Description [Please provide me with as much detail as possible.]
k. Contact Owner (Person that manages the contract register)
l.

A1

CPV codes/Pro-Class

. See attached — FOI1202223-286 Contracts Register

. See attached — FOI202223-286 Contracts Register

. See attached — FOI202223-286 Contracts Register
. See attached — FOI1202223-286 Contracts Register
f. See attached — FOI1202223-286 Contracts Register
g. See attached — FOI202223-286 Contracts Register
h. See attached — FOI202223-286 Contracts Register
i. See attached — FOI202223-286 Contracts Register
j- See attached — FOI1202223-286 Contracts Register
k. See attached — FOI1202223-286 Contracts Register
l. Information not held — the Trust does not routinely collate or hold this information
centrally as part of its management or performance data.

a
b
c. Information not held — the Trust does not routinely hold this information
d
e

Q2 Can you also provide me with contact details of the person responsible for the actual
contract’s register or someone responsible for AP1? [Name, Job Title, Telephone, Email
Address] At the very least provide me with their actual job title.

A2 Steven Doran — Head of Procurement Steven.Doran@NHS.net



[3M United Kingdom pic
Fesis L1d (EQUIPMENT/SUPPORT) / TDSI
[Aidence BV

[Attend Anywhere

verpool Heart and Chest PO 124198 e
[iverpool Heart and Chest PO 124180995 [Access Control Secury Passes
verpool Heart and Chest FO 124164369 TAidence (Reference sie 1-year duration
[Video Conferencing

Gonfrol service and maintenance
2 Nodule Analysis and Reporting AT S

Liverpcol Hear and Chest INHSE Framework
verpool Heart and PO 124196886 Sherry S
erpoolear and Ghest 1 g g Medirest
verpool Heart and Chest [Cath Lab Scheduling Softwa cal Sof [Carecube
[iverpool Heart and Chest Chidcare Vouchers hildcare vouchers EdenRed 700,000.00
for Go6s Not process personal data on bahalf of he Trust, Se6 6-mall of
iverpool t INHSE Framework Clinical Software Vital Hub (previously Oak Group) 2310012018 2200012 12 months 32,400.00
o project ref. FTS Ref No 202175 000-022853 LotT [Clinical waste serv 2300412027 24 months 540,000.00
Govemance sofware unueumumn hosting and 0110412027 n 744000
S Framework Agreement for The Provision of Healthcars Clieal Informafion Services Electronic paient record system and maitenance ENIS 21122017 2171212022] 54 months 574,692.00
Confidential Waste Destruction Ser Conidanta Wast Destnion Sonices [Shred Tt
[COSHH Management Services vision of risk management services [Alcumus Sypol Cimited [ 54,000
fris 550,000.00 |
Block 4 Tnder ref. DL5 Bluewire Technologies 444,000.00 |
Tnfra: Tinical Imagining. lincal systems support & developme|Alder Hey (Digital Systems 7.625,472.00

Wersey Care
[Allscripts Healthcare IT UK Limited

cironic patient o
24 months.
nonths notice of intention to extend)

ment for the Provision of Healthcare Clinical Information Services |Electronic Patient Record Supporl Serv

lverpool Fear 3nd Chest INHS SBS Framework Agre

(Trust must give 6-

MIS Health
gra (o-Quip) Limted

cironic patient records order comms services

onths.

information system services NHS SBS |EMIS Tquest contract details to be added here when signed

Framework for provision of healtcare i

Liverpool Heart and Chest

Chos PO up
Chest FSSF LHCO00T240070 Roster Rostorng Software and Services: HealhRoster Saas | S oo Fota S Canceatonpian (e a5 | Rloome Sotge L T2 months
5 0766 Rostoring Suppor Sorvices Support for Rostering Software and Senvcos SCOATocate Sprin 1 Framowork
Chest e Tendering System enderngsotware and support soices
THER0T penses Hoall Serioes penses Hoalh S
CHCo0T xpensos Hoall Services ob evalutor
[0 ornal Audi Servioos ol Audt Sorvice
nance Procurerent Syt FiancelProcurement Syeiem Sofware and suppor Sevces
G2 Spooch Digial Dicaton; Suppor and MaGrance Seices: OWsourced Transcrpion|Sofware and Suppor Services
5 003-00262 (NS ROV-T8AKC Fagmofiiration Equipment and Consumabes Fasmoffration Equpment Service Support and Consumables months
ok refroros R featthcare Comms TSMS reminderiigtal Totr soluions TZmonths x T
ety maging Phase 1 plot - Cardology Archiving System TSCY) 5 month
7 monthe

ol formaton Syl AT Pationt Admisiraion System and Support Services

T equipment type)

iy based (rale
Activity based

et or dspos

e Prehange ot BB

20 o and Support Services
LHC001151220 instant Pay agesteam
Shesi [POT2aT67227 ellspace [Phiips Healthcare T 5766720
i nterpreter and Translation Senvices nterpreter and Translation Sen TLanguage Line Limited Actviy based
S5S framework RES-NHSFA LORES NASFALOL erproter and Translation_Services. erproter and Translation_Services. oA Language:
nterpreter and Translation Services nterpreter and Translation Services (Sgr1anguage)

553 farvowork RBENHST,
E 35:000.00

hventory Management System and Software Support Services.

o ventory Management Sysiem
CocH e Linen and Laundry Services’ inen and Laundry Services
e HCH app Vioble app and web app Content Managoment Sysiom (CHS]
ria L service and malntenance it service and maintenance 3 79,048.45
o Dispense and delvery of med i Aciiy based
ria vl o lone woke:devie merTTo g SGUpmETT e 2950200
NS626012102 [Vioble Voice and Data Services Aciiy based
/0163 [Modular Bulding Hire 5063
osi TG Devics Wonftorng (Lafiude I [Ginical Montoring Sevices
Chest 1CD Device Monftoring (Care Link] [Monitoring Services [Clnical Monttoring Services Vedironic
Chesi [Tro200 WUTT-Functon Dovices it sorices Ronica Minolta o570
Chest RMB9T atural Gas [Supply of Natural Gas TTotal Aciiy based
Chesi POT24T07555 Network Inastructure SupporNartenance Network ni o Support Services iterciy Technoloay T 943350
Chest PO 124201606 fembership Database System Database Services Chvica UK Limited 5.160.00
Shesi e uvoar [Telemedicine - Spriometer and associated moble app Nuvoar T30.000.00
Chest rla [Occupallonal Healh Sevices [Occupational Health service Team Prever
3 T sito Data Gentre - Ciical and DIgial nformation Systers Framework (CDIS [Oif ste Data Genire - Ginical and Digial Information Systems Senices Taimes 0000000
INFS SBS T5CWZWD/BBA6108 [Of ste Medical Records Storage [Offsite document storage and destruction Restore rforation not eld ~ransactional costs
352564 201 -EN ACS Picture Archiving and Communication System Senvices Caresream 562.612.00
i3 Sayroll Servces ¢
POT2AT66822 Porfect Ward
rla Pharmacy Secure Courer Semice 5
o Pharmacy Secure Courler Service Fiormation Not Hld —T al Costs
/0207 Sharmacy System Software and SUpport VIS ] 0
o Tiview o Softvars Servioes GikHealth Soutons
POT2420325T Radiation Proteclion Services Radiation Protection Services RS Limited
352564 201 -EN Radiology nformation Serv Pationt Adminisiraiion Systom and Support Services 7SS Theing Software Group Lid) 2600
PO 124152897 Radiology Maintenance Services [Service and maintenance of radiology equipment Mount Intermational United Servces months 175.000.00|
Radiology Senices Radioloay Services cal Stafing Radiology Managemen “months Aciy based (rae per hou |
Recrument Senvi NHS Jobs,
PO 124146506 Rhapsody Integration Engine niogralion Engine sofwars Toending. raining and support & maienance Cyniato
000008 Risk Management Software and SUpport Risk man and suppor servces Datix LT 705.000.00
ok~ Link soluions T2 S/ TO/ABIWABIOATT Robocic Process Automation Provision and implementation of Roboctic Process Automation (RPA] tochnology and services [Trustco pic 344,664.00
iz [Staf loans [Salad Money
o oo Vioble 335 37 et 557 ConarT MAmSGement Sysar (O] Gynoray Tia Shinyminds
PO 1241948 omerset Cancer Regiser Sytom supor [Somerset NFS FT 3108
FTEsFoz627 emporary Workiorce Soluions 2 ovision of temporary viorkers (al calegories] Rimerous SuppTers Tndar T Z5/012023 iy based
iz ext Messaging Services Tesi Mssaging Seriees Limited £ 50000
o opcal Temporature Montorng System [Supportfor drug fidge emparature monfiorng Promatica
CCS Framewark ravel Management Services Travel services fresten T
PO 124203431 o GG device Ii Aciviy based
[iverpool Heart and Chest 319 10 Vivip Managed Services Platform and assodated Staf benefis HOTT @ vy 3




	286 Disclosure Log
	286 FOI Response

