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Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital m

NHS Foundation Trust

FOI1202223/284
Private Individual
02 November 2022

Details of vendor neutral archive systems used

System type — Vendor Neutral Archive
a. Supplier name
b. System name
c. Date installed
d. Contract expiration

Information not held - we do not have a vendor neutral archive system.

Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No

a.
b. Procurement framework

c. Other systems it integrates with?

d.

e. Notes - e.g. we are currently out to tender

Do you currently have plans to replace this system? Yes/No

Total value of contract (£)

Information not held - we do not have a vendor neutral archive system.



