

Reference FOI2021/281

Number:

From: Private Individual

**Date:** 13 August 2021

**Subject:** Courier Service Contracts

- Q1 Please send me details for the period 2020-2021 on the following:
  - a. The total value of the courier service contracts that were outsourced
  - b. The name of your primary courier supplier
  - c. The value of your primary supplier's contract
  - d. The expiry date of that contract
  - e. The total cost of the courier services that were not outsourced but managed inhouse?
  - f. The number of staff employed in managing the in-house contracts
  - g. The number of vehicles either owned or leased to meet the in-house courier requirement
  - h. The name and email of the person responsible for the management of courier services
- A1 a. £33,551.88 annual cost with primary supplier, however secondary supplier is used ad hoc and as such no contract value is available.
  - b. ESR Medical with TNT (now known as Fedex)
  - c. £33,551.88 per annum ESR Medical
  - d. Information not held there is no formal contract in place
  - e. Information not held all courier services are outsourced
  - f. Information not held all courier services are outsourced, and we do not have any inhouse contracts
  - g. Information not held all courier services are outsourced, and we do not have any inhouse contracts
  - h. Sharon Hindley, Head of Facilities, sharon.hindley@lhch.nhs.uk