Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital m

NHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOI1202223/279

Number:

From: Commercial

Date: 28 October 2022

Subject: Detail of Trusts leads/board members

Q1 Please could you provide us with leader's name for the below leadership roles.

If you have a very similar role but not the exact job title, please include details of the very
similar role and individual. If you don't have this role at all, please state N/A or “Don’t have

the job title”.
Also, please you include the names and job titles of any of the board members that are not
listed below.

AT Job Title Leaders Name

Information exempt under Section 21 of the
Freedom of Information Act 2000 - ‘Information
reasonably accessible to the applicant by other
a. Chair means’.

For details see information available on our
website, Our Board of Directors | Liverpool Heart
and Chest Hospital (Ihch.nhs.uk)

Information exempt under Section 21 of the
Freedom of Information Act 2000 - ‘Information
reasonably accessible to the applicant by other
means’ — see a. above

b. Chief executive

Information exempt under Section 21 of the

c. Director of Finance & Freedom of Information Act 2000 - ‘Information
Information reasonably accessible to the applicant by other

means’ — see a. above

Information exempt under Section 21 of the
Freedom of Information Act 2000 - ‘Information
reasonably accessible to the applicant by other
means’ — see a. above

d. Medical Director

Information exempt under Section 21 of the
Freedom of Information Act 2000 - ‘Information
reasonably accessible to the applicant by other
means’ — see a. above

e. Director of Nursing

Information exempt under Section 21 of the
Freedom of Information Act 2000 - ‘Information
reasonably accessible to the applicant by other
means’ — see a. above

f. Chief Operating Officer

g. Director of Communications

and Marketing Information not held — Don’t have the job title

No such role - This falls within the remit of our

h. Director of HR and OD Chief People Officer, see a. above



https://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/our-board-of-directors/
https://www.lhch.nhs.uk/about-lhch/our-board-of-directors/
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Chief People Officer

Information exempt under Section 21 of the
Freedom of Information Act 2000 - ‘Information
reasonably accessible to the applicant by other
means’ — see a. above

No such role — This falls under the remit of Director
of Risk and Improvement. For details see

J- E;;i(:%;()f Strategy and information gvailable on our website, Our B_oard of
Directors | Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital
(Ihch.nhs.uk)
Information exempt under Section 21 of the
Freedom of Information Act 2000 - ‘Information
k. Chief Pharmacist reason,ably acces_sible j[o the applicant_by other
means’. For detail see information available on our
website, Pharmacy | Liverpool Heart and Chest
Hospital (Ihch.nhs.uk)
. Director of Corporate This role falls under the remit of our Director of
Governance/Company Ri
isk and Improvement, See a. above
Secretary/Board Secretary
Information exempt under Section 21 of the
m. Director of Risk and Freedom of Information Act 2000 - ‘Information
Improvement reasonably accessible to the applicant by other
means’ — see a. above
Information exempt under Section 21 of the
n. Director of Strategic Freedom of Information Act 2000 - ‘Information
Partnerships reasonably accessible to the applicant by other
means’ — see a. above
No such role - Falls under the remit of Clinical Lead
o. Director of Research and for Research. For details see information available
Innovation on our website, Our Research Team | Liverpool
Heart and Chest Hospital (Ihch.nhs.uk)
p. Head of Legal Services Information not held — Don’t have the job title
q. Lead Director fo_r Procurement Information not held — Don’t have the job title
(Procurement Director)
Information exempted under Section 40: Personal
r. PA to Chief Executive data. Providing this information would likely identify
individuals involved.
s. Chief Clinical Information This role falls under the remit of our Medical
Officer Director, see d. above.
. . No such role — This role falls within the remit of our
t. Director of Infection Control : .
Medical Director, see d. above
u. Head of Estates Adam Hope
No such role — This role falls within the remit of our
v. Chief Information Officers/IT thef Digital an_d Information officgr. For details see
Director |nformat|on gvallable on our website, Our B_oard of
Directors | Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital
(Ihch.nhs.uk)
w. Head of Hotel Services Information not held — Don’t have the job title
x. Head of Private Patients Information not held — Don’t have the job title
y. Head of Sterile Services Information not held — Don’t have the job title
z. Head of Facilities Management |Sharon Hindley
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The Trust is unable to respond to all or specific elements of your request where the
response would indicate five or less individuals. The Trust is withholding this information
under Section 40 (Personal Information) of the Freedom of Information Act (FOIA) 2000 to
reduce the risk of any individuals being identified. The Trust is of the view that disclosure of
such information would significantly increase the risk of individuals being identified and as
such would constitute a breach of their personal data.

The Trust has applied exemption Section 40(2) of the FOIA and is therefore withholding
the information as disclosure which may identify an individual would breach their rights
under the Data Protection Act 2018. The grounds for application of this exemption include:

Any data relating to patients or staff is third party data, furthermore health data is
classified as sensitive personal data within the Data Protection Act 2018. As such,
Section 40 (2) of the FOIA applies along with the Trusts duty of confidentiality.
Therefore under s.2 (3) (f) (ii) of the FOIA, there is an absolute exemption from
disclosure on the grounds that it would contravene the First Data Protection
Principle.

The Trust has a duty under the Data Protection Act 2018 and specifically the First
Data Protection Principle to ensure personal data regarding staff and patients is
processed fairly and lawfully. Disclosure of such data which may identify an
individual, either through the data alone or other data in conjunction with that data
which may identify an individual would therefore breach this principle.

The Data Protection Act 2018 defines sensitive personal data to include data
relating to the “physical or mental health or condition” of a person. Any such
information about specific individuals falls within this category and disclosure of
such data including statistical data, with any potential likelihood of identification
would breach the Data Protection Act 2018.



