
 
 
Reference 
Number:  

FOI202223/260 

From: 
 

Commercial 

Date: 
 

12 October 2022 

Subject: 
 

networking and communications technology 

 
Paste table from response letter 
Q1 When was your last networking (LAN, Core, edge) refresh, and when is the next refresh 

planned? 
  
A1 2014, review 2024 
  
Q2 When was your last Wi-Fi refresh, and when is the next refresh planned? 
  
A2 2021, review 2025/26 
  
Q3 When was your last telephony or Unified Communications refresh, and when is the next 

refresh planned? 
  
A3 2014, review 2024 
  
Q4 When was your last mobile devices/pagers refresh, and when is the next refresh 

planned? 
  
A4 Information not held – Pagers are provided as part of a contract with Liverpool University 

Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust. Please contact them directly at 
FOIRequests@liverpoolft.nhs.uk 

  
Q5 Can you confirm contract end dates and vendors for the above? 
  
A5 Telephony is managed in house – out of hours support provide by Clatterbridge Cancer 

Centre rolling 12 months 2023. 
  
Q6 Do you have an integration or workflow solution across the multiple technology systems 

in the trust? 
  
A6 Yes, Rhapsody 
  
Q7 What are the key parts of your Digital Transformation and/or Hospital of the Future 

strategy going forward? 
  
A7 1) Connecting Digitally with Patients and Families 

2) Digital Safety and Outstanding Care 
3) Insight Led Care 

  
Q8 What adoption of Internet of Things has been implemented? 

a. Do you have an IOT containment policy? 
  
A8 Information not held - The Trust does not currently hold an Internet of Things policy. 
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Q9 What adoption of asset tracking/real-time asset monitoring or Radio Frequency 

Identification (RFID) has been implemented or is being considered or planned? 
a. Does this include patient flow? 
b. Can you confirm contract dates and vendors? 

  
A9 Information not held – The Trust does not currently have an RFID solution and has no 

plans to implement one at this time.   
 


