Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital m

MNHS Foundation Trust

Reference FOI1/2020/251
Number:
From: Private Individual

Date:

10 September 2020

Subject: Breakdown of Surgical Procedures 2018-2020

| am interested in the following information:-

Q1

Al

Q2

A2

Hospital name
Total of all surgeries
For the years 2018-2020

ONE ICD-9 CODES
89.6| 89.67| 89.68| 100.0| 100.01| 100.02| 100.03| TOTAL

ICD - 10
Classification for Main
Diagnosis

TOTAL

89.6 Cardiovascular monitoring;

89.67 Monitoring of cardiac output by oxygen consumption;

89.68 Monitoring of cardiac output using another technique;

100.1 General anaesthesia

100.2 Endotracheal general anaesthesia with extended monitoring (up to 2 hours)
100.3 Endotracheal general anaesthesia with extended monitoring (2 to 4 hours)
100.4 Endotracheal general anaesthesia with extended monitoring (over 4 hours)

If cannot provide with ICD-9 Code classification could you provide the equivalent by ICD-10
Classification?

Information not held - The Trust does not routinely record monitoring codes for
anaesthetics using ICD-9 Codes or any equivalent codes.

TWO ASA Physical Status Classification System Code

Code | Code| Code| Code| Code| Code TOTAL
1 2 3 4 5 6

ICD-10
Classification for Main Diagnosis

TOTAL

Information not held - The Trust does not routinely record ASA Physical Status
Classification System Code



Q3

A3

Liverpool Heart and Chest Hospital m

MNHS Foundation Trust

THREE

Total Number of Procedures for
Each Classification

ICD - 10
Classification for Main Diagnosis

TOTAL

If the data is not held for each hospital please can it be provided at a Trust level? If the
data is not held for all of the years 2018-2020 can it be provided for any of the years?

Please see attached document: FOI2020 251 Response




SpellPrimaryDiagnosisCode

Count of ICD10

C33X 9
M841 5
Q256 2
R53X 1
1081 308
E320 1
1452 12
A415 3
LO89 3
1240 5
D696 1
1930 11
C340 70
K108 2
RO5X 19
K228 1
1985 36
N390 3
Co11 1
1362 2
1939 206
R042 36
D861 38
M549 2
L509 1
C450 116
1713 1
110X 7
K297 1
D171 1
1856 59
R101 8
R232 2
C844 1
U072 2
1447 80
1748 1
C793 1
Q212 5
C780 247
D34X 2
G580 1
2034 2
K048 1
7136 128
2098 14
E854 7
C812 1
E119 1




1059 2
K432 4
1988 2
1969 3
1702 2
1439 58
RA2X 48
1350 346
E049 14
1278 1
E101 1
D022 12
2087 2
1425 2
1980 18
1330 147
1219 31
1209 1
R13X 3
G403 1
E835 1
1888 11
Q203 10
M898 1
D151 28
J151 4
R222 3
Q213 6
C343 581
C159 12
C64X 1
1862 3
1860 5
K046 1
1080 399
1518 183
1499 8
C783 3
E669 1
D630 5
C509 3
1251 9531
1716 65
1371 12
1889 65
M899 1
C224 1
Q205 1
1821 227
122X 12




1460 26
1253 5
1890 1
M954 1
C782 105
1941 3
164X 1
K083 10
1513 6
C781 16
R570 1
C342 74
1201 42
C382 1
E668 1
1484 145
1220 4
1719 2
1453 24
G931 1
1849 14
D367 1
1825 8
1341 6
1711 7
R092 2
1782 1
G610 1
1813 18
R619 1
1448 2
K036 2
1159 1
Q791 1
R002 98
T175 13
1254 18
1779 3
1984 168
1272 18
D821 1
D594 1
C348 1
1728 5
1427 3
1828 1
1428 161
1938 14
G933 1
5278 1




Q233 8
RO74 377
A099 1
Q211 234
1211 1307
C153 2
C795 5
C494 1
1609 1
Q238 1
Al54 1
K047 1
Q250 5
Q311 1
114X 4
1329 1
C56X 1
D649 9
C792 1
1456 118
1823 14
C884 2
1082 59
1818 30
J100 2
1250 1
D143 15
Q263 9
1494 2
D167 1
1951 5
7122 2
Q201 3
1500 100
1495 145
1690 1
1741 3
K225 1
1260 1
Z038 12
1871 5
D380 1
E329 1
181X 2
T860 1
M313 2
D383 1
1710 169
1432 1
C160 4




Q222 4
1489 878
R0O68 6
L988 1
C966 1
C445 1
1458 2
1200 53
K559 1
1119 3
N184 1
R0O72 115
K053 5
1949 4
1423 2
5272 5
M258 2
E274 1
R090 2
C341 1027
1189 16
C381 4
1481 1338
ROO0O 29
1814 81
5499 1
R0O71 4
B376 1
1309 12
RO48 1
1229 2
MO009 1
1986 5
Q180 2
7431 1
1839 1
7488 1
1519 81
D152 6
Q228 1
BA487 1
1491 6
1479 2
7408 1
T835 1
1443 7
D508 2
K222 2
R931 4
J101 2




C473 1
1840 1
C166 1
1400 2
D500 2
Q246 11
Q254 1
T178 5
1501 64
E875 3
Q232 2
1828 51
1998 3
Q208 2
1181 48
E86X 1
1471 730
A310 1
C865 1
1712 360
A419 6
1824 1
J90X 294
1249 159
C857 1
B99X 1
D862 1
1429 18
Q872 1
C811 5
1313 64
R568 1
1233 2
Q262 3
G540 2
1351 32
E611 101
1383 1
K918 1
1051 1
1721 1
D150 31
C809 5
7119 1
E048 1
R0O62 1
1881 1
R11X 3
1352 143
C771 236




1212 247
C457 1
5250 1
E162 1
R401 1
D695 1
1771 5
J040 1
1490 154
1441 195
1269 27
1201 1
Q206 2
147X 116
K011 1
B679 2
E328 2
T810 19
1483 304
1052 24
J950 2
1209 32
EO79 1
R509 7
C798 6
1221 8
7115 1
R599 3
1398 54
1469 9
2035 16
Q221 6
D529 1
1638 1
1088 398
1110 3
K519 1
1841 50
1948 8
1812 3
140X 1
5432 1
C169 2
K550 1
J180 1
1214 136
1886 1
R611 3
C97X 42
1459 23




R33X 1
Q244 5
R91X 467
7450 29
5211 1
1132 1
1515 1
1820 60
D142 6
5271 11
Q253 1
1241 2
1929 9
5222 1
1050 2
T858 14
C770 1
1083 1006
R55X 323
1931 115
K439 4
1724 1
K010 23
M255 4
1822 2
RO60 30
1449 14
Q231 38
C413 2
1510 1
1739 1
J955 5
G951 1
R798 1
C492 1
K830 1
1208 59
E848 10
M850 2
R103 2
D868 20
G439 1
1472 589
K029 35
1441 25
5223 1
Q255 4
1633 1
R0O01 64
K590 3




1258 130
1827 83
A411 1
1715 14
Q240 1
180X 1
R229 1
G711 1
RO61 2
R104 7
2092 1
RO73 51
R508 1
Z031 1
Q224 5
1301 4
J155 1
1959 4
7139 1
C852 2
R748 1
1259 17
Q859 1
E871 2
D382 1
C37X 1
C772 1
R590 200
C154 5
1851 1
1772 1
1421 72
1426 3
D174 4
Q324 1
J958 1
1459 2
1386 13
1440 28
142X 1
L910 1
C73X 5
U071 30
164X 1
1672 1
G409 2
C380 1
R18X 2
1509 288
R943 48




1319 107
Q200 1
2006 2
1235 1
C493 2
Q969 1
1451 9
1470 23
1420 487
K449 8
E052 2
C817 1
E841 9
R296 1
C349 45
1409 9
Q251 25
K219 4
1635 2
R0O70 1
Q220 4
A047 1
1340 166
7138 6
1219 1
1252 1
G119 1
C851 2
B441 6
1723 3
1493 89
1228 2
M548 1
C814 1
Q245 3
A410 4
1482 36
1213 42
C833 1
1714 27
Q230 10
1829 1
Z090 10
1438 1
R190 1
1440 26
1857 5
T179 1
0994 1
R591 11




1311 12
Q264 1
R100 1
C155 10
D487 5
D361 7
1826 6
1455 63
M869 4
K800 1
F329 1
1514 14
5241 1
1381 1
M840 1
D509 113
1743 2
1071 7
K220 1
1232 9
1852 4
1679 11
1372 4
C821 1
Q790 1
7137 4
1210 1074
N179 2
G900 1
Z452 2
J13X 2
J990 1
D177 1
1342 1
160X 2
G700 6
K766 1
K564 1
1422 97
E840 887
D860 15
1869 69
1517 8
7458 90
R610 1
Q204 3
T460 1
A490 4
C859 6
1288 1




1318 2
1700 1
1981 22
S308 1
1480 1188
1450 1
Q225 3
1418 3
1255 196
E042 16
7201 1
7128 1
1898 6
1498 162
2080 4
A412 1
1231 1
Q210 13
D381 19
1942 16
E041 1
1442 463
1778 5
C388 1
D157 1
R688 1
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